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NJ ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT AUTHOR NJ ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT AUTHOR Quotation #: { 21650693
PO BOX 990 Quotation Date: | 06/13/14
TRENTON NJ 08625 Expiration Date: | 07/13/14
ePIU$ ATTN: TOM MURPHY Client Reference: [ Jabra Headsets
Qu Otatlo n ) Account Rep: | Kim Guenther
Qty Part Number MFG Name Description Unit Price | Extended Price
5 |9326-607-405 GN NETCOM GN9350E WRLS HEADSET SYSTEM PHONEPCUSB 1.9GHZ DECT6.0 350FT NC 214.04 1,070.20
5 [14201-16 GN NETCOM GN CISCO HHC CORD CISCO HEADSET HOOKSWITCH CORD 21.52 107.60
By ’ prodigtsor T atd Conditions for  chasing Products and Services locatedt . _ and~conditions/Pages/Products-Services-Terms-and-Conditions (the "Order Tesms"). Unless is & separate written
) . ) Order T shallbe © - " and conditions applicable to ; between you . and no addifional or contrary terms referenced in a purchase order, or electronic cormun;. shall apply. Inno
ewnts\;gﬂé?lm . undera . | deemed uocqptaﬂceo' anytes  itions set forth therein: S e e : o B - . . Lo

“ePlus offers flexible a‘hd'easy Ieasing options for your IT equipmént Use leasing to increase'your {T acquisition cyapability, overéome limited budgets. and manage the lifecycle of your assets. Contact an ePlus
Leasing Coordinator at 1-703-984-3021 or leasing@eplus.com to receive a lease quote today.

Thank you for your inquiry. Please note the following about this quotation: It will expire on the date stated above. Unless freight amount is indicated, or is zero, freight will be added to the invoice. Unless Bill-To company is
exempt from Sales Tax, it will be added to the invoice. Extended Warranties and Professional Services are available.

Customer Acceptance To Place An Order , Please Contact:
_ . SubTotal: $1,177.80
Signature: Date: Sales: Lisa Hockenbury
. . Est. Tax: TBD if Applicable
Name: PO #: Phone: 610-495-1240 PP
Title: Ship VIA: Fax: 610-495-1208 Freight: $0.00
This quotation is confidential for your internal use only. .
This 1s a salicitation for an offer and is subject to credit approval. No contract is formed unless a email: hockenbury@eplus.com
pgrchase‘order or other offer is rcceived‘ and accepted by our office. lf_you accept this quotation Address: 130 Futura Drive - Pottstown, PA 19464 Total: $1,177.80
with the intent to have your chosen leasing company to pay the costs directly, please note that if the
Lessor does not pay ePlus for any reason, you will be responsible for payment to ePlus.




Nancy Meyers

From: Kim Guenther [kguenther@EPLUS .com]

Sent: Monday, June 16, 2014 9:07 PM

To: Nancy Meyers

Cc: Geraldine M. Stout; Lisa Hockenbury

Subject: RE: CLARIFICATION REQUEST - ADDENDUM #1 - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION - Jabra
Wireless Headsetsand Adapters

Attachments: NJEDA-RFB Standard Terms - Conditions Rev 05 (10-22-12).pdf

Nancy, Thank you. Regarding ePlus’ quote #21650693, our Contract Management Department is in agreement with
NJEDA's attached Terms and Conditions. Please let me know if you need anything else. Have a nice evening.

Thank you,
Kim

Kimberly M. Guenther
Senior Account Executive
ePlus Technology, inc.

642 Newtown Yardley Road
Newtown, PA 18940

Ph: 609-528-8915

Fax: 609-528-8997

Cell: 215-779-6019
Kguenther@eplus.com

MaitScanner hus detected g possible fraud attempt from “urldefense.proofpoint.com” cloiming to be www.eplus.com

.

The information contained in this electronic tronsmission ond ony ottachments hereto may be considered proprietary and confidentiol. Unauthorized distribution of
this material to enyone other than the addressed is prohibited. Any disclosure, distribution or use of this transmission for any reason cther than their intended
purpose is prohibited,

From: Nancy Meyers [mailto:NMeyers@njeda.com]

Sent: Monday, June 16, 2014 4:41 PM

To: Kim Guenther

Cc: Geraldine M. Stout

Subject: CLARIFICATION REQUEST - ADDENDUM #1 - REQUEST FOR QUOTATION - Jabra Wireless Headsetsand
Adapters

Importance: High

Hi Kim,

I've attached Lisa’s email with attachments.
The Quotation appears to be the first attachment — Quotation #21650693

Nancy Meyens

Nancy C. Meyers

Procurement Officer

Internal Process Management Department





