
NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 4 NO BID

NAME OF BIDDER TEC ELEVATOR UNITED STATES ELEVATOR, INC. ZIP SYSTEMS, INC. THYSSENKRUPP ELEVATOR

ADDRESS 3121-D BOX 220 FIRE ROAD 1275 BLOOMFIELD AVENUE, BLDG. #9, UNIT 81 38 OLD CAMPLAIN ROAD 420 NORTH 2ND ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP EGG HARBOR TOWNSHIP, NJ  08234 FAIRFIELD, NJ 07004 HILLSBOROUGH, NJ 08844-4293 HAMMONTON, NJ 08037

CONTACT ROBERT SHAW KERRY FINNERTY JOHN WEIGELE MAUREEN MCCARTHY

TELEPHONE 800-395-7270 973 244 1300  609-567-2333

FAX 609-390-0946 973 244 1306  609-567-2366

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL TECELEVATOR@VERIZON.NET KF.USELEVATOR@COMCAST.NET WWW.TYHYSENKRUPPELEVATOR.COM

EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES   

BID BOND AMERICAN CONTRACTORS INDEMNITY COMPANY 10% OF 
BID BONDEX INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE $150K COLONIAL SURETY COMPANY 10% NTE $13,800

CONSENT OF SURETY JEFFREY R. BAUMAN AIF WITH POA MEGAN BAUER AIF WITH POA ANTHONY J. CIMASKO AIF WITH POA

INSURANCE NEEDED IF AWARDED AS PER PAGE 38 NEEDED IF AWARDED AS PER PAGE 38 NEEDED IF AWARDED AS PER PAGE 38

REQUIRES AA201 FROM AWARDED CONTRACTOR AA201 MUST BE COMPLETED NEEDED IF AWARDED  INCLUDED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE NOTICE SIGNED SIGNED NOT INCLUDED - NEEDED IF AWARDED

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED REQUIRED REQUIRED

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK OK

NON-COLLUSION SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED

EQUIPMENT CERT SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK

REFERENCES INCLUDED - ED TO CHECK INCLUDED INCLUDED

PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 658832 EXPIRES 7/29/09 648969 EXPIRES 3/26/09 MUST RENEW 19540 EXPIRES 4/30/09 MUST RENEW  

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR POLICY SIGNED SIGNED NOT INCLUDED - NEEDED IF AWARDED

98-1 SIGNED SIGNED NOT INCLUDED - NEEDED IF AWARDED

99-1 SIGNED SIGNED NOT INCLUDED - NEEDED IF AWARDED

REFERENCES  THREE INCLUDED - ED URBANIK TO CHECK  THREE INCLUDED - ED URBANIK TO CHECK  THREE INCLUDED - ED URBANIK TO CHECK

SIGNED PROPOSAL OK INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED  

PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE

TOTAL PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE FOR TWO YEAR 
PERIOD $50,040.00 $69,792.00 $75,000.00

REPAIR

TOTAL FOR REPAIR YEAR ONE AND YEAR TWO 
(BASED UPON REGULAR LABOR RATE) $25,000.00 $28,800.00 $45,000.00

GRAND TOTAL FOR PM AND REPAIR $75,040.00 $98,592.00 $120,000.00

COOP AND COUNTY REPAIR RATE (OUTSIDE PM)

LABOR RATE YEAR ONE AND TWO FOR REPAIR 8:00 
AM THROUGH 4:30 PM $125.00 $144.00 $225.00

LABOR RATE YEAR ONE AND TWO FOR REPAIR 
PRIOR TO AND AFTER REGULAR HOURS $200.00 $216.00 $450.00

MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT WHOLESALE PLUS 
MARKUP 10% 10% 40%

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE  NONE 

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO

CONTRACT PERIOD TWO YEARS , COOP BASED UPON HOURLY RATE; REQUIRE PERFORMANCE AND 
LABOR AND MATERIAL PAYMENT BOND

BID RESULTS
CK09MERCER2009-04B PREVENTATIVE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR OF ELEVATORS, ESCALATORS AND CHAIR LIFTS

MARCH 18, 2009

mailto:TECELEVATOR@VERIZON.NET�
http://www.tyhysenkruppelevator.com/�
mailto:KF.USELEVATOR@COMCAST.NET�


 

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 2

NAME OF BIDDER N & B MARINE SUPPLY, INC. DMM IND, INC.

ADDRESS 63 ROUTE 130 NORTH PO BOX 877
403 S. STATE STREET

CITY, STATE, ZIP BORDENTOWN, NJ 08505 OWOSSO, MI  48867

CONTACT WILLIAM A. BULLECKS DIANE M. GAGNIER

TELEPHONE 609-298-3658 800-367-3057

FAX 609-298-4569 989-723-6165

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL NBMARINE@VERIZON.NET DIANEG@PADDLEWHEELER.COM

INSURANCE MC NEEDED IF AWARDED

NEW JERSEY BRC  OK NOT REQUIRED - OUT OF STATE, WILL SHIP TO NJ FOB 
DESTINATION

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EIC #27202 EXPIRES 10/15/2013 REQUIRED - SEND AA302

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE NOTICE OK OK

EXHIBIT A REQUIRED - INSERT EXHIBIT A REQUIRED - INSERT EXHIBIT A

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK

COST FOR TEN (10) 2009 TRACKER GUIDE V14 OR
EQUIVALENT RIVETED DEEP V UTILITY BOAT FOB 
DESTINATION

                                                                                    16,770.00  NO BID 

COST FOR NINE (9) PWIR PADDLE WHEELER OR 
EQUIVALENT PADDLE BOATS - FOUR SEAT MODEL 
FOB DESTINATION

 NO BID                                                                                     16,716.24 

COST FOR ONE (1) 2009 PWIR-PC PADDLE 
WHEELER OR EQUIVALENT PADDLE BOAT - FOUR 
SEAT MODEL WITH GRAB RAILS FOB DESTINATION

 NO BID                                                                                       3,692.66 

GRAND TOTAL FOR PADDLE BOATS                                                                                     20,408.90 

EXCEPTIONS  NONE  SPEC SHEET INCLUDED 

AB2009-13 ROW BOATS AND PADDLE BOATS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY PARK COMMISSION
FOR USE AT THE MERCER COUNTY MARINA

MARCH 18, 2009

BID RESULTS

mailto:NBMARINE@VERIZON.NET�
mailto:DIANEG@PADDLEWHEELER.COM�


NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 6

NAME OF BIDDER OM OFFICE SUPPLY, INC. VIDEO MARKETING SYSTEMS, INC. SOUND STAGE PRODUCTIONS, INC. COLLEGE TV, INC. ADVANCED PROCUREMENT SALES, 
LLC LUCILLE MAUD CORPORATION

ADDRESS 5007 CARLISLE PIKE, SUITE 101 240 SOUTH MAIN STREET 358 SACKETT POINT ROAD 1440 SOUTH OLDEN AVENUE PO BOX 110952 513 NORTH OLDEN AVENUE

CITY, STATE, ZIP MECHANICSBURG, PA  17050 SOUTH HACKENSACK, NJ 07606 NORTH HAVEN, CT 06473 TRENTON, NJ  08610 BROOKLYN, NY 11211-6219 TRENTON, NJ 08638

CONTACT MANISH AGARWAL BERNARD FEURER KARL KEISLICH JOSEPH F. GENOVARIO JEFF ROSENTHAL ANTHONY T. JACKSON

TELEPHONE 717-763-4216 609-393-7555 X5491 203-230-0226 609-526-5337 718-513-5760 609-393-7555 X5490

FAX 717-763-4354 609-393-1141 203-230-0446 609-890-8314 718-513-5761 609-393-1140

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL MANI@OMOS.COM LMCSALES@LUCILLEMAUD.COM KARL@SOUNDSTAGESYTEMS.COM COLLEGETV1@JUNO.COM JEFF@APSALESGOV.COM LMCSALES@LUCILLEMAUD.COM

EXTEND TO COOP NO NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED YES

INSURANCE NEEDED IF AWARDED NEEDED IF AWARDED NEEDED IF AWARDED INCLUDED NEEDED IF AWARDED NEEDED IF AWARDED

NEW JERSEY BRC  OK OK
NOT INCLUDED - CT BRC 

INCLUDED; IF ONSITE, MUST HAVE 
BRC

OK OK OK

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EIC NEEDED IF AWARDED AA302 INCLUDED - EIC NEEDED IF 
AWARDED NEEDED IF AWARDED INCLUDED AA302, EIC NEEDED IF 

AWARDED
AA302 INCLUDED - EIC NEEDED IF 

AWARDED NEEDED IF AWARDED

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE NOTICE SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED OK SIGNED

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK OK OK OK OK

 98-1 SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED

BASE BID (INCLUDING DELIVERY)
COST FOR ONE NEW VIZIO OR EQUIVALENT 
V022LF HDTV 22” LCD at 1920 x 1080 RESOLUTION 
FLAT PROFILE 22” LCD TELEVISION $285.75 $259.70 $314.00 $347.00 $389.00 $467.02

COST FOR 200 (TWO HUNDRED) NEW VIZIO OR 
EQUIVALENT V022LF HDTV 22” LCD at 1920 x 1080 
RESOLUTION FLAT PROFILE 22” LCD TELEVISIONS

$57,150.00 $49,940.00 $62,800.00 $69,400.00 $77,800.00 $93,404.00
COST FOR 82 CEILING MOUNT BRACKETS $4,920.00 $12,990.00 $2,050.00 $12,874.00 $14,000.00 $9,816.22
COST FOR 118 WALL MOUNT BRACKETS $1,416.00 $3,590.00 $2,354.10 $5,546.00 $3,056.00 $7,255.82
GRAND TOTAL FOR 200 TELEVISIONS, OWNER 
MANUALS, DEMONSTRATION AND 200 BRACKETS WITH 
ONE YEAR WARRANTY $63,486.00 $66,520.00 $67,204.10 $87,820.00 $94,856.00 $110,476.04

ADDITIONAL COST FOR INSTALLATION OF ALL UNITS 
(CABLING AND ELECTRICAL WORK IS NOT REQUIRED NO BID - OUT OF STATE $19,000.00 $23,590.00 NO BID $99,000.00 $26,182.60

TOTAL WITH INSTALLATION NO BID FOR INSTALLATION $85,520.00 $90,794.10 NO BID FOR INSTALLATION $193,856.00 $136,658.64

EXCEPTIONS  NONE 

 SUBSTITUTING COBY TFTU2224; 
DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE 
ATTATCHED WALL MOUNT 

PEERLESS SF630; CEILING MOUNT 
PEERLESS PC930; NEED TO 
SPECIFY COLOR AT TIME OF 

ORDER 

 SUBSTITUTING VIEWSONIC - 
VT2230  NONE 

 SUBSTITUTING SAMSUNG 
LN22A450 LCD HDTV; WILL DO 

INSTALL AS QUICKLY AS POSSIBLE, 
BUT CANNOT GUARANTEE IT WILL 

BE DONE IN ONE WEEK  

 SUBSTITUTING NEC EA241WM-RK 

FATAL FLAW  NO  NO  NO - NJ BRC NOT REQUIRED IF 
ITEMS ARE SHIPPED  NO  NO   NO 

BID RESULTS
CK09MERCER2009-08 PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF NEW VIZIO (OR EQUIVALENT) VO22LF HDTV 22" LCD AT 1920 X1080 RESOLUTION TELEVISIONS, CEILING TELEVISION MOUNTS AND WALL TELEVISION MOUNTS FOR THE MERCER COUNTY 

GERIATRIC CENTER
MARCH 19, 2009

OPEN END FOR ONE YEAR FOR COOP 

mailto:MANI@OMOS.COM�
mailto:JEFF@APSALESGOV.COM�
mailto:COLLEGETV1@JUNO.COM�
mailto:LMCSALES@LUCILLEMAUD.COM�
mailto:LMCSALES@LUCILLEMAUD.COM�
mailto:KARL@SOUNDSTAGESYTEMS.COM�


CONTRACT TO COMMENCE 5/31/09 FOR TWO 
YEARS WITH TWO YEAR OPTION BASED UPON 
INDEX RATE; FORWARD SAMPLE TO WARDEN 
ELLIS

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 2

NAME OF BIDDER CAMDEN BAG AND PAPER COMPANY LLC ALL CLEAN JANITORIAL SUPPLY CO. INC.

ADDRESS 114 GAITHER DRIVE 990 SPRUCE STREET

CITY, STATE, ZIP MT. LAUREL, NJ 08054 LAWRENCEVILLE, NJ 08648

CONTACT ROBERT GERBER JOHN MCHUGH

TELEPHONE 856 727 3313 609 695 5444 EXT. 31

FAX 856 727 4114 609 695 2727

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL RGERBER@CAMDENBAG.COM JOHN@ALLCLEANINC.COM

INSURANCE REQUIRED IF AWARDED REQUIRED IF AWARDED

NEW JERSEY BRC  OK OK

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION EIC 6095 EXPIRES 11/15/12 40714 EXPIRES 9/15/14

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK

SAMPLE INCLUDED  YES  YES 

COST PER CASE (200 TRAYS)                                                                                            13.89                                                                                            15.80 

COST FOR 10,920 CASES                                                                                   151,678.80                                                                                   172,536.00 

EXCEPTIONS  QUOTED GENPAK MODEL #203VW, CASE PACK 200  NO 

FATAL FLAW  NO  NO 

BID RESULTS

AB2009-11 FOOD TRAYS FOR A PERIOD OF TWO YEARS WITH OPTION TO EXTEND TWO YEARS

BID OPENING MARCH 20, 2009

mailto:RGERBER@CAMDENBAG.COM�
mailto:JOHN@ALLCLEANINC.COM�
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