CKO9MERCER2009-06C SECURITY SYSTEM INSTALLATION PM AND REPAIR

BID RESULTS

August 18, 2009

CONTRACT PERIOD: 2 YEARS, ELECTRICAL LICENSE, BURGLAR
ALARM LICENSE AND LOCKSMITHING LICENSE; 10% MARK-UP ON
WHOLESALE EQUIPMENT

PER GEORGE DELUCA AT CONSUMER
AFFAIRS, LOCKSMITHS CAN NOT
SUBSTITUTE AN ELECTRICAL LICENSE
FOR LOCKSMITH LICENSE

NUMBER OF BIDDERS

3

NAME OF BIDDER

J Il ELECTRONICS, INC.

ABSOLUTE PROTECTIVE SYSTEMS, INC.

DYNAMIC SECURITY

ADDRESS

25359 MT. PLEASANT ROAD

3 KELLOGG COURT UNIT 13

55 CARTER DRIVE, SUITE 106

CITY, STATE, ZIP

COLUMBUS, NJ 08022

EDISON, NJ 08817

EDISON, NJ 08817

CONTACT HERBERT J. ECCLES IlI PAUL SMOLEY BARTON KARTOZ
TELEPHONE 609-890-1352 732 287 4500 732985 3331
FAX 609-291-0974 732 287 4502 732 985 3339

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL

J3ELECTRONICS@COMCAST.NET

BARTON.KARTOZ@KYNAMICSEC.COM

EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS

YES

YES

YES

INSURANCE

NEED

NEED

NEED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE EXHIBIT B; REQUIRES AA201

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED, MUST COMPLETE AA201

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED, MUST COMPLETE AA201

EXHIBIT B INCLUDED, MUST COMPLETE AA201

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT

X

X

X

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION FOR GC

OK

OK

OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE

OK, INCORPORATED 4/24/92 TWO SH > 10%

SUBCHAPTER S, SH REFERENCED

LLC, WITH OWNERS REFERENCED

EQUIPMENT CERT OK OK OK
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION FOR ELECTRICIAN YES IN-HOUSE NOT INCLUDED
FIVE YEARS EXPERIENCE YES YES YES

PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION FOR GC

616341 EXPIRES 4/14/11

50307 EXPIRES 5/14/10

669641 EXPIRES 3/19/10

BURGLAR ALARM LICENSE (EXEMPTED THROUGH ELECTRICAL LICENSE)

HERBERT J. ECCLES Il 34BA00098000

34EI101411800 EXPIRES 3/31/12

34BL00000500 JERALD WEXELBERG

LOCKSMITH LICENSE

NOT LICENSED AS LOCKSMITH

NOT LICENSED AS LOCKSMITH

34BL00000500 JERALD WEXELBERG

PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION FOR ELECTRICAL

661900 EXPIRES 1/30/10

IN-HOUSE

605460 EXPIRES 10/6/10

ELECTRICAL LICENSE

BRUNO ROTONDO #34EB01475400 EMGEN
ELECTRICAL SERVICES 3/31/12

34EI01411800 PAUL SMOLEY

GERHART ELECTRIC INC. DENNIS GERHART
34EI100664700 EXPIRES 3/31/12

AUTHORIZED DEALER OF

NAPCO, ADEMCO, PELCO, SONY

BOSCH, RADIONICS, SILENT KNIGHT,
FARENHYT, PYRO CHEM, RANGE GUARD,
NAPCO, ADEMCO

DHS, AIMETIS, COMMEND, GENETEC,
TALAPHONE, ADEMCO, HONEWELL

REFERENCES INCLUDED - B&G TO CHECK INCLUDED - B&G TO CHECK INCLUDED - B&G TO CHECK
HOURLY RATE REGULAR HOURS WITH 10% MARKUP ON MATERIALS 75.00 92.00 98.00
OVERTIME RATE 150.00 184.00 127.00

FATAL FLAW

NOT LICENSED AS LOCKSMITH

NOT LICENSED AS LOCKSMITH

DID NOT INCLUDE BRC FOR ELECTRICAL SUB



mailto:J3ELECTRONICS@COMCAST.NET�
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BID RESULTS

AB2009-38 GOLF SUPPLIES

AUGUST 18, 2009

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

CATALOGS WITH PRICING OR PRICING SHEETS
MUST BE SUBMITTED WITH BID

NAME OF BIDDER

EASY PICKER GOLF PRODUCTS

PRESTWICK GOLF GROUP

LESCO, INC.

GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS, INC.

R & R PRODUCTS INC.

ADDRESS

415 LEONARD BLVD.

1880 EXECUTIVE DRIVE

1301 E. 9TH ST., SUITE 1300

4 MIDDLEBURY BLVD., SUITE 7

3334 E. MILBER STREET

CITY, STATE, ZIP

LEHIGH, FL 33971

OCONOMOWOC, WI 53066

CLEVELAND, OH 44114-1849

RANDOLPH, NJ 07869

TUCSON, AZ 85714

CONTACT

CHRIS FOSS

STEVE SYRJALA

MARGARET DVOVRNAK

KENNETH P. KUBIK

TIM PRINGLE

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL

CHRISF@EASYPICKER.COM

SSYRIALA@PRESTWICKGOLFGROUP.COM

BIDS@JOHNDEERELANDSCAPES.COM

KEITH.KUBIK@GRASSROOTSTURFONLINE.COM

TPRINGLE@RRPRODUCTS.COM

TELEPHONE 800 641 4653 800 505 7926 216 706 9250 973-252-6634 800 528 3446
FAX 1239 368 6600 800 962 3455 248 581 1433 973-252-6630 520 294 1045
INSURANCE NEED NEED INSURANCE NEED INSURANCE NEED INSURANACE NEED INSURANCE

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE

NEED EIC, EXHIBIT A INCLUDED

NEED EIC, EXHIBIT A INCLUDED

NEED EIC, EXHIBIT A INCLUDED

#11885 EXPIRES 8/15/13

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED, NEED EIC

'STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE

OK, CORPORATION

OK, CORPORATION

OK, CORPORATION

OK, CORPORATION

OK, CORPORATION

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK oK
DELIVERY 5 DAYS ARO NOT REFERENCED 7 - 10 DAYS ARO s BLI‘II)TL\‘SESCSUE;{?Z)SM NO?(’I;-EI:gEl’;T%RQY;J§mSE;SBg:\I{’;ESS 2 - 5 DAYS ARO
CATALOGS EASY PICKER GOLF PR(;;EJCC;S 2009 CATALOG LIST PRESTWICK GOLF GS?SL(J:%SQ?TER CATALOG 15% PAR AIDE 21% DISCOUNT PAR AIDE 18% DISCOUNT (NOT LOW) R & R PROUDCTS - LIST PRICING ON CD

STANDARD GOLF 18% DISCOUNT

MARKERS INC. - 10% DISCOUNT

EAGLE ONE - LIST
COMPLIANCE SAFETY 5%

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE DIb NOT INE;EDEigthCéJ/:;%GRASéILHOSE ITEMS NONE
FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO
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BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2009-19 STATIONERY FOR MERCER COUNTY AND COOP FOR ONE YEAF

August 1

8, 2009

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

NAME OF BIDDER

CMF BUSINESS SUPPLIES INC.

W.B. MASON CO., INC.

MY NJ OFFICE, LLC

CENTRAL LEWMAR LLC

RIS PAPER COMPANY INC.

ADDRESS

3622 KENNEDY RD.

59 CENTRE STREET

39 MCCLELLAN STREET REMIT TO: BOX 4310, LINDEN,

NJ 07036

1200 HIGHLAND BUSINESS DRIVE

1705 SUCKLE HIGHWAY

CITY, STATE, ZIP

SOUTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07080

BROCKTON, MA 02301

NEWARK, NJ 07114

WESTAMPTON, NJ 08060

PENNSAUKEN, NJ 08110

CONTACT LOUIS M. ANGELUCCI DANIEL ORR JR. ALAN C. JACKSON MICHAEL POLANSKY JOHN H. KENNEDY JR.
WEBSITE OR E-MAIL LOU@CMFE.NET DANIEL.O ON.COM ALAN@MYNJOFFICE.COM MNORTH4@OPTONLINE.NET JACK.KENNEDY@RISPAPER.COM
TELEPHONE 908-753-0800 888 926 2766 908 862 4700 609-915-0362 800 257 7905
FAX 908-753-0420 508 427 4460 908 862 3965 609-518-9736 856 488 0718
INSURANCE NEED NEED NEED NEED NEED
EXTEND TO COOP (YES OR NO) YES YES YES YES YES

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK CORPRATION WITH STOCKHOLDER NAMED OK CORPRATION WITH STOCKHOLDERS NAMED OK CORPRATION WITH STOCKHOLDERS NAMED OK OK
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REQUIRED #10144 EXPIRES 3/15/13 28060 EXPIRES 4/15/14 NEED EIC NEED EIC 1207 EXPIRES 2/15/15
EXCEPTIONS CONVERSIONS CONVERSIONS CONVERSIONS CONVERSIONS CONVERSIONS
FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO



mailto:LOU@CMF.NET�
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COUNTY OF MERCER PAPER SPECIFICATIONS

SHEETS OR
ITEM UNITS PER COST PER COST PER COST PER COST PER
# DESCRIPTION CARTON OR | CARTON/CASE BRAND CARTON/CASE BRAND CARTON/CASE BRAND CARTON/CASE BRAND LOWBID
CASE
CONVERTED CONVERTED CONVERTED CONVERTED CONVERTED
WB MASON CMF MY NJ OFFICE CENTRAL LEWMAR RIS
1 White, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, 5M/Ctn 5000 27.18 MASON 27.45 DOM 27.65 | SP RICHARD 31.00 29.50 DOMTAR 27.18
2 White, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, 5M/Ctn Recycled* 5000 30.55 | BOISE AS 30 31.48 34.92 | HAMMERMILL 44.00 32.40 DOMTAR 30.55
3 White, 8 1/2" x 14", 20#, 5M/Ctn - Recycled* 5000 41.55 | BOISE AS 30 44.25 53.57 | HAMMERMILL 57.00 43.50 DOMTAR 41.55
4 Forebond Colors, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, 5M/Ctn - Recycled* 5000 32.90 | BOISE FW 32.48 47.20 | HAMMERMILL 39.00 36.00 EXACT 32.48
5 White Forebond 11" x 17, 24#, 2M/Ctn 2000 65.45 | HAMMERMILL 30.52 | HAMMERMILL 44.00 35.00 DOMTAR 30.52
6 Capital Bond Cockle Finish, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, 5M/Ctn 5000 97.00 95.50 CAPITAL 95.50
7 Royal Laid White 8 1/2 “ x 117, 24#, 5M/Ctn 5000 120.00 118.00 [ WAUSAU ROY 118.00
8 White Forebond 8 1/2" x 11", 24#, 4M/Ctn 4000 59.00 | HAMMERMILL 32.86 | HAMMERMILL 44.00 34.00 DOMTAR 32.86
9 Atlas Bond White #403 - 25% Cotton Fiber 8 1/2" x 11" 20# 5M 5000 153.26 |[SOUTHWORTH| 108.00 108.00
10 Vellum Bristol, Ivory, 8 x 1/2" x 11", 67#, 2M/Ctn 2000 40.00 | SPRINGHILL 49.88 48.73 WAUSAU 44.00 36.20 EXACT 36.20
11 Vellum Bristol, Colors, 8 %2” x 11", 67#, 2M/Ctn 2000 40.00 | SPRINGHILL 49.88 48.73 WAUSAU 44.00 36.20 EXACT 36.20
12 Vellum Bristol, Ivory, 11" x 17", 67#, 2M/Ctn 2000 89.80 [ SPRINGHILL 44.00 76.40 EXACT 44.00
13 Exact Opaque Colors, 8 1/2" x 11", 70#, 1.5/Ctn 1500 60# WAUSAU 49.00 18.13 EXACT 18.13
COLORED PAPER: 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, 5M/Ctn (Requires the following colors)
14 Blue, Canary, Green, Goldenrod, Buff, Red, Salmon, Cherry, Pink 5000 32.90 BOISE FW 32.48 DOMTAR 41.05 UNIV 39.00 | SPRINGHILL 36.00 | EXCLUDES RED 32.48
52.00 FOR RED
15 White Domtar Forebond 60# 8 1/2" x 14" 5m 5000 62.50 WILLIAMS 56.75 DOMTAR 56.75
16 White Forebond 28# 8 1/2" x 11" Microprint Multisystem/4M carton 4000 47.95 DOMTAR 47.95
17 Domtar Colors (Hots) 8 1/2" x 11" 65# Carton 2500 65.99 87.50 BRITES 77.13 ASTROBRIT 65.99
18 Green 1/2" x 11", 60# Domtar #6709120 Carton 5000 65.99 DOMTAR 56.00 | SPRINGHILL 48.95 EXACT 48.95
19 Blue Vert 8 1/2" x 11" 60# Domtar #6709005 Carton 5000 -
20 Domtar Opaque Colors 8 1/2" x 14" 60# 5m 5000 68.00 | SPRINGHILL 65.60 EXACT 65.60
21 White, 14 7/8" x 11", 20#, 2.5M/Ctn 2500 29.95 | MASON SBC 29.18 DOMTAR 39.64 UNIV 35.00 40.32 | ENTERPRISE 29.18
22 White, 9 1/2" x 11", 20#, 2.7M/Ctn 2700 20.12 | MASON SBC 21.12 DOMTAR 27.21 UNIV 27.00 26.30 | ENTERPRISE 20.12
23 Green Bar, 14 7/8" x 11", 20#, 2.7M/Ctn 2700 30.42 | MASON SBC 31.10 DOMTAR 43.21 | SP RICHARD 36.00 43.55 | ENTERPRISE 30.42
3 HOLE PUNCHED
24 White, 8 1/2" x 11", 20#, 5M/Ctn 5000 29.75 | MASON FLAG 32.57 DOMTAR 34.75 UNIV 38.00 32.50 DOMTAR 29.75
INDEX, SCOTTS: MILL BRAND
25 White, 8 1/2" x 11", 110#, 2M/Ctn 2000 38.40 | SPRINGHILL 39.50 65.75 WAUSAU 38.00 38.50 EXACT 38.00
COLORED INDEX SCOTTS: MILL BRAND
8 1/2" x 11", 110#, 2M/Ctn (requires the following colors)
26 Blue, Green, Canary, Buff, Salmon, Cherry 2000 48.00 [ SPRINGHILL 40.50 39.00 39.20 EXACT 39.00
27 Orange, Red 8 1/2 X 11", 65#, 2M/Ctn 2000 40.50 39.00 71.50 | EXACT BRIGHT 39.00
CHIP BOARD
28 81/2" x 11" 27.00 27.00
COST PER
CARTON FOR
COMPLETE
CARBONLESS PAPER, EXCEL PAPER SET
COLORED PRE-COLLATED, 5 PART:
29 White, Green, Canary, Pink, Goldenrod 8 1/2" x 11", 20# 1250 Sets 200.00 159.25 NEKOOSA 159.25
30 White, Green, Canary, Pink, Goldenrod 8 1/2" x 14", 20# 1250 Sets 200.00 202.88 NEKOOSA 200.00
PRE-COLLATED, 4 PART:
31 White, 8 1/2" x 11", 20# 1250 Sets 97.51 UNIV 129.00 165.80 NEKOOSA 97.51
COLORED PRE-COLLATED, 4 PART:
32 White, Canary, Pink, Goldenrod, 8 1/2" x 11", 20# 1250 Sets 101.32 | SP RICHARD 139.00 123.10 NEKOOSA 101.32
33 White, Canary, Pink, Goldenrod, 8 1/2" x 14", 20# 1250 Sets 177.00 156.70 NEKOOSA 156.70
PRE-COLLATED, 3 PART:
34 White, 8 1/2" x 11", 20# 1670 Sets 90.48 UNIV 119.00 149.50 NEKOOSA 90.48
COLORED PRE-COLLATED, 3 PART:
35 White, Canary, Pink 8 1/2" x 11", 20# 1670 Sets 88.68 | SP RICHARD 129.00 115.40 NEKOOSA 88.68
36 White, Canary, Pink 8 1/2" x 14", 20# 1670 Sets 159.00 146.90 NEKOOSA 146.90
COLORED PRE-COLLATED, 2 PART:
37 White, Canary 8 1/2" x 11", 20# 2500 Sets 93.78 | SP RICHARD 110.00 102.30 NEKOOSA 93.78
38 White, Canary 8 1/2" x 14", 20# 2500 Sets 144.00 130.10 NEKOOSA 130.10
NCR, 1-PART:
39 Mead CFB, White, 81/2" x 11", 20#, 5M/Ctn 5000 140.00 168.70 NEKOOSA 140.00




COUNTY OF MERCER PAPER SPECIFICATIONS

SHEETS OR
ITEM UNITS PER COST PER COST PER COST PER COST PER
# DESCRIPTION CARTON OR | CARTON/CASE BRAND CARTON/CASE BRAND CARTON/CASE BRAND CARTON/CASE BRAND LOWBID
CASE
CONVERTED CONVERTED CONVERTED CONVERTED CONVERTED
WB MASON CMFE MY NJ OFFICE CENTRAL LEWMAR RIS
XEROX PREMIUM DIGITAL CARBONLESS PAPER
NEKOOSA
40 CFB UNIVERSAL SINGLES, White, 81/2" x 11", 23#, (3R12435) 5000 187.20 IMATION 187.20
41 2-Part Straight Collated, White/Canary, 81/2" x 11", 23#, (3R12420) 2,500 Sets 155.00 3M 150.50 DIGITAL 22 150.50
42 2-Part Straight Collated, White/Canary, 81/2" x 14", 23#, (3R12422) 2,500 Sets 208.00 3M 190.20 DIGITAL 22 190.20
43 3-Part Straight Collated, White/Canary/Pink, 81/2" x 11", 23#, (3R12425) 1,670 Sets 171.00 3M 156.50 DIGITAL 22 156.50
44 3-Part Straight Collated, White/Canary/Pink, 81/2" x 14", 23#, (3R12427) 1,670 Sets 216.00 3M 190.20 DIGITAL 22 190.20
45 4-Part Straight Collated, White/Canary/Pink/Goldenrod, 81/2" x 11", 23#, (3R12430) 1,250 Sets 238.00 3M 156.50 DIGITAL 22 156.50
46 5-Part Straight Collated, White/Green/Canary/Pink/Goldenrod, 81/2" x 11", 23#, (3R12453| 1,000 Sets 277.00 3M 179.20 DIGITAL 22 179.20
(10 REAMS PER CARTON)
PLOTTER:
47 HP Heavyweight Coated Paper 6.4 ML, 35Ib. 54" x 100’ 92.00/Roll 71.99 HP 76.00 HP 71.99
48 HP Heavyweight Coated Paper 42" x 100" 57.20/Roll 58.69 HP 65.00 HP 58.69
FINE PAPER: HAMMERMILL VIA:
81/2" x11":
49 Brite White, 70# text, 3M/Ctn 3000 67.00 106.13 VIA 67.00
COLORED FINE PAPER: HAMMERMILL VIA:
8 1/2” X 11 70# (requires the following colors)
50 Sunflower, Periwinkle, Rockland Green, 3000 81.00 65.63 VIA 65.63
Fog/light blue, Ivory, Yellow, 70# text, 3000/Ctn
11" x 17"
51 Brite White, 70Ib Text 11 x 17 - min. 67.5lb 2000 39.75 63.73 LYNX 39.75
COLORED 11” x 17”:
70# text, 2000/Ctn (requires the following colors)
52 Parchment, Fog/light blue, Yellow, Buff, Rockland Green, Ivory, Buff, 2000 88.00 36.10 EXACT 36.10
Salmon, Gold, Natural
CLASSIC LINEN:
53 Silverstone, 8 1/2" x 11", 80# text 5000 216.00 216.00
GEORGIA-PACIFIC HOTS:
8 1/2" x 11", 60# text, 5000/Ctn (requires the following colors)
54 Gold, Blue, Teal, Canary, Red, Lime Green, Pink, Orange 5000 68.50 67.10 [ASTROBRIGHTS 67.10
ENVELOPES:
55 Royal Laid White #10, 24#, 2.5M/Ctn 2500 122.00 143.00 | ROYAL NATURAL 122.00
56 #9, Reg., Whitewove, 24#, 2.5M/Ctn 2500 81.67 | SP RICHARD 44.00 36.30 | ROYAL NATURAL 36.30
57 #10, Reg. Whitewove, 24#, 2.5M/Ctn 2500 32.78 | SP RICHARD 39.00 34.30 | ROYAL NATURAL 32.78
58 #10 Wnd., Whitewove, 24#, 2.5M/Ctn 2500 54.87 | SP RICHARD 42.00 42.25 | ROYAL NATURAL 42.00
59 #11, Whitewove, 28#, 2.5M/Ctn 2500 61.00 105.80 | ROYAL NATURAL 61.00
60 #10, Window Blue Tint, 24# (Self Sealed) 2500/Carton #89030 2500 129.00 187.60 | ROYAL NATURAL 129.00
61 6 x 9, White, 28#, Open End Top - No Clasp 2500 100.00 90.00 | ROYAL NATURAL 90.00
62 6 x 9, Kraft, 28#, Open End Top - No Clasp 2500 193.70 WEST 102.00 106.75 [ ROYAL NATURAL 102.00
63 9 x 12, White, 28# Open End Top - No Clasp 2500 178.42 | SP RICHARD 121.00 117.00 [ ROYAL NATURAL 117.00
64 9 x 12, Kraft, 28#, Open End Top - No Clasp 2500 144.40 | SP RICHARD 123.00 159.00 [ ROYAL NATURAL 123.00
65 10 x 13, Kraft, 28#, Open End - No Clasp 2500 182.42 | SP RICHARD 131.00 197.00 [ ROYAL NATURAL 131.00
66 12 x 15, Manilla, 28#, Open End - No Clasp 2500 219.00 486.00 | ROYAL NATURAL 219.00
67 9 x 12, Kraft, 28#, Booklet - No Clasp 2500 161.00 163.25 | ROYAL NATURAL 161.00
68 10 x 15, Kraft, 28#, Booklet - No Clasp 2500 255.00 445.25 | ROYAL NATURAL 255.00
NEKOOSA SOLUTIONS:
69 Parchment, 8 1/2" x 11", 70# text 3000 90.00 65.63 VIA 65.63
70 Spice, 8 1/2" x 11", 70# text 3000 81.00 65.63 VIA 65.63
71 Beige/Natural, 8 1/2" x 11", 70# text 3000 77.00 65.63 VIA 65.63
72 Gray, 8 1/2" x 11", 70# text 3000 77.00 65.63 VIA 65.63
NEENAH:
73 #10 Classic Laid Writing Envelope, Classic Natural White, 24# 3000 169.20 169.20
74 Classic Laid Writing, Classic Natural White, 8 1/2" x 11", 24# 3000 94.20 94.20
COATED PAPER (coated on both sides)
DOMTAR, FUTURA LASER, NEKOOSA OR HAMMERMILL
75 8 1/2" x 11", 80# text 5000 101.25 FUTURA 96.25 MOHAWK 96.25
76 8 1/2" x 11", 80# cover 5000 180.00 FUTURA 175.00 MOHAWK 175.00
77 8 1/2" x 11", 100# text 5000 123.33 FUTURA 118.33 MOHAWK 118.33
78 8 1/2" x 11", 100# cover 5000 225.00 FUTURA 216.67 MOHAWK 216.67




COUNTY OF MERCER PAPER SPECIFICATIONS

SHEETS OR
ITEM UNITS PER COST PER COST PER COST PER COST PER
# DESCRIPTION CARTON OR | CARTON/CASE BRAND CARTON/CASE BRAND CARTON/CASE BRAND CARTON/CASE BRAND LOWBID
CASE
CONVERTED CONVERTED CONVERTED CONVERTED CONVERTED
WB MASON CMFE MY NJ OFFICE CENTRAL LEWMAR RIS

79 11" x 17", 80# text 2000 81.00 FUTURA 56.46 | CHORUS ART 56.46
80 11" x 17", 80# cover 1000 72.00 FUTURA 53.17 | CHORUS ART 53.17
81 11" x 17", 100# text 1500 74.00 FUTURA 52.95 | CHORUS ART 52.95
82 11" x 17", 100# cover 750 68.00 FUTURA 50.70 | CHORUS ART 50.70
83 13" x 19", 80# text 1250 69.00 FUTURA 46.68 | CHORUS ART 46.68
84 13" x 19", 80# cover 1250 152.80 FUTURA 87.92 | CHORUS ART 87.92
85 13" x 19", 100# text 1250 93.50 FUTURA 58.38 | CHORUS ART 58.38
86 13" x 19", 100# cover 1250 180.00 FUTURA 111.38 | CHORUS ART 111.38

UNCOATED PAPER

DOMTAR, FUTURA LASER, NEKOOSA OR HAMMERMILL

81/2" x11":
87 70# _Linen /Classic Avon Brillant White 5000 186.25 186.25

11" x 17"
88 67.5# text-Regular Bond /Soporset White Smooth 2500 52.50 47.80 DOMTAR 47.80
89 70# text Linen Pure White 2000 76.00 90.65 VIA 76.00
90 65# Cover- PARCHMENT MAGNA CARTA 2800 134.40 320.00 | MAGNA CARTA 134.40
91 80# Cover- SOLOR White SMOOTH (225 GSM) 1000 121.00 121.00
92 100# Cover-White and Ivory /110 LB INDEX 1000 131.00 44.85 EXACT 44.85

13" x 19":
93 70# text-Regular Bond/ Soporset Opague Smooth 2000 88.00 88.00
94 80# Cover-Sterling Ultra Dull ream (250) 1000 105.00 65.92 | CHORUS ART 65.92
95 100# Cover-Sterling Ultra Dull ream (250) 1000 110.00 83.60 | CHORUS ART 83.60

81/2" x 14"
96 70# text -Regular Bond 2000 29.50 29.50

COLORED PAPER (requires the following colors)

8 1/2” x 147, 70# text

EXACT - NO
CHERRY - PINK,

97 Green, Yellow, Cherry 2000 35.50 30.63 YES 30.63

MISCELLANEOUS:
98 R1-2" Deep Letterhead Boxes 8.5 x 11 200 per Carton 200 75.00 78.00 PRESTIGE 75.00
99 Fanapart Glue (Quart) Quart 16.00 26.25 NEKOOSA 16.00
100 [Padding Compound (Quart) Quart 12.00 12.00
101 BC-2 Business card Boxes 3 1/2 x 7 3/4 (100) per Box 100 61.00 76.00 PRESTIGE 61.00




PROPOSAL RESULTS

RFP 2009-02BG ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULTING AND ANALYSIS SERVICES FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR

August 20, 200

9

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

13

MULTIPLE CONTRACTS MAY BE AWARDED

NAME OF RESPONDENT

CME ASSOCIATES

LANGAN ENGINEERING & ENVIRONMENTAL
SERVICES

BRINKERHOFF ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES,

WARREN & PANZER ENGINEERS, PC

THE RBA GROUP

INTERNATIONAL HYDRONICS CORP.

PENNONI ASSOCIATES, INC.

1913 ATLANTIC AVENUE, SUITE RS

ADDRESS 3759 US HIGHWAY 1, S., SUITE 100 50 WEST STATE STREET, SUITE 1002 228 EAST 45TH STREET 7 CAMPUS DRIVE, SUITE 300 PO BOX 243, 5 CRESCENT AVENUE 515 GROVE STREET, SUITE 1B
CITY, STATE, ZIP MONMOUTH JCT., NJ 08852 TRENTON, NJ 08608 MANASQUAN, NJ 08736 NY, NY 10017 PARSIPPANY, NJ 07054 ROCKY HILL, NJ 08553 HADDON HEIGHTS, NJ 08035
CONTACT BEHRAM TURAN, P.E. PRINCIPAL JORGE H. BERKOWITZ, PH.D. LAURA . BRINKERHOFF JEFFREY TERHUNE, PE WILLIAM GARRO, PE LAYNE R. MOULTON PETER J. COOTE
WEBSITE OR E-MAIL BTURAN@CMEUSAL.COM JBERKOWITZ@LANGAN.COM LBRINKERHOFF@BRINKENV.COM JTERHUNE@WARRENPANZER.COM WGARRO@RBAGROUP.COM LMOULTON@INTERNATIONALHYDRONICS.COM PCOOTE@PENNONI.COM
 TELEPHONE 732 951 2101 609 656 2810 732 223 2225 212 922 0077 973 946 5600 609-921-9216 856-547-0505

FAX 732 951 2106 609 656 2815 732 223 3666 212 922 0630 973 984 5421 609-921-8282 856-547-9174
[ADDENDUM #1 RECEIVED RECEIVED RECEIVED DID NOT ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM #1 RECEIVED DID NOT ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM #1 RECEIVED
INSURANCE: PL $1MM, $2MM GL AGGREGATE, $1MM AUTO NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE

#1818 EXPIRES 2/15/11

#12699 EXPIRES 10/15/11

#12218 EXPIRES 9/15/13

NEED IF AWARDED

3551 EXPIRES 8/15/12

NEED

#2919 EXPIRES OCT 15, 2009

EXHIBIT A

INSERT

INCLUDED

INSERT

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

[STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE

OK WITH PARTNERS REFERENCED AND SIGNED

OK WITH STOCKHOLDERS REFERENCED AND

OK WITH STOCKHOLDER REFERENCED AND

OK WITH STOCKHOLDER REFERENCED AND

OK WITH STOCKHOLDERS REFERENCED AND

OK WITH STOCKHOLDER REFERENCED AND

OK WITH STOCKHOLDER REFERENCED AND

SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED
[COMPLIES WITH 2004-14 YES YES YES YES YES YES
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK OK X
QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
LAB TEST AMERICA AQUA PRO-TECH LABORATORIES LLC, EMSL, PACE EMLAB P&K, DIVISION OF TEST AMERICA ACCUTEST LABORATORIES SAME TEST AMERICAN AND EM LAB P&K
KEY PERSONNEL INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
LICENSURE 24GE03921000 THROUGH NJ CON AFF INDIVIDUAL P.E. 24GA28001700 THROUGH NJ CON AFFAIRS | 24GE02267400 THROUGH NJ CONS AFFAIRS 24GE01626800 T:;:?:s: NJ CONSUMER - 24GE02867500 T:E&L:S: NJ CONSUMER INDIVIDUAL PE'S

NELAC ACCREDITATION

NELAC

INCLUDED #07010 THROUGH NJ DEP

PAGE 23 SECTION 111

NELAC

NELAC THROUGH NJ DEP

NELAC THROUGH NJ DEP

NELAC THROUGH NJ DEP

ELCP ACCREDITATION

PAGE 23 SECTION 111

DISCIPLINES

UNDERGROUND STORAGE TANK
REMEDIATION, ENVIRONMENTAL
ASSESSMENTS, SOIL SAMPLING AND
TESTING, NJ STATE GREEN ACRES PROGRAM

REFERENCED ON PAGE 1, SECTION 1,
INTRODUCTION

PHASE I, I SITE ASSESSMENTS, SOIL,
GROUNDWATER, REGULATORY COMPLIANCE
ETC., INTRO, PAGE 2

REFERENCED ON PAGE 1

REFERENCED IN PRIMARY CONTRACTOR
STATEMENT

FULL SERVICE ENVIRONMENTAL FIRM

REFERENCED IN OPENING NARRATIVE

SUBCONTRACTORS

INDOOR AIR QUALITY, HAGER, PRIME
ENVIRONMENTAL, SUBSURFACE
ENVIRONMENTAL, PINE ENVIRONMENTAL
SERVICES

FEE SHEDULE INLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED WITH TERMS AND CONDITIONS

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED
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PROPOSAL RESULTS

RFP 2009-02BG ENVIRONMENTAL CONSULTING AND ANALYSIS SERVICES FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR

August 20, 200!

9

NAME OF RESPONDENT

ENVIRONMENTAL CONNECTION INC. A
VERTICAL TECHNOLOGIES CORPORATION

O'BRIEN & GERE ENGINEERS, INC.

THE LOUIS BERGER GROUP, INC.

MELICK-TULLY AND ASSOCIATES, P.C.

GOULD ENVIRONMENTAL INC.

J M SORGE, INC. ENVIRONMENTAL
CONSULTANTS

NO RESPONSE:

[ADDRESS 120 NORTH WARREN STREET 1090 KING GEORGES POST ROAD, SUITE 904 | 412 MOUNT KEMBLE AVENUE, PO BOX 1946 117 CANAL ROAD 701 N. PENNA. AVENUE 57 FOURTH STREET VEN NOTE - HARVEY
CITY, STATE, ZIP TRENTON, NJ 08608 EDISON, NJ 08837 MORRISTOWN, NJ 07962-1946 SOUTH BOUND BROOK, NJ 08880 MORRISVILLE, PA 19067 SOMERVILLE, NJ 08876-3235 777 ALEXANDER ROAD
CONTACT RICHARD J. BEACH GARY A. ANGYAL, PE THOMAS G. LEWIS, PE RICHARD D. LEV DREW A. GOULD STUART SPADY PRINCETON, NJ 08540
WEBSITE OR E-MAIL RBEACH@VTIGH.COM ANGYALGA@OBG.COM WWW.LOUISBERGER.COM RLEV@MELICK-TULLY.COM DGOULD@VERIZON.NET WWW.JMSORGE.COM

TELEPHONE 609 398 4200 732 225 7380 EXT. 257 973 407 1386 732 356 3400 215 295 2400 908 218 0066

FAX 609 392 1216 732225 7931 973 267 6468 732 356 9054 215 295 9383 908 218 9185

ADDENDUM #1 RECEIVED RECEIVED RECEIVED RECEIVED DID NOT ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM #1 DID NOT ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM #1

INSURANCE: PL $1MM, $2MM GL AGGREGATE, $1MM AUTO NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE NEED EIC #3585 EXPIRES 6/15/10 #3135 EXPIRES 10/15/10 #4383 EXPIRES 9/15/12 24184 EXPIRES 1/15/12 #37339 EXPIRES 8/15/12

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INSERT INSERT INSERT INCLUDED

[STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE

REFERENCED WITH STOCKHOLDERS
REFERENCED AND SIGNED

OK, NO SH, SIGNED

OK WITH SH REFERENCED AND SIGNED

OK WITH SH REFERENCED AND SIGNED

OK WITH SH REFERENCED AND SIGNED

OK WITH SH REFERENCED AND SIGNED

INCLUDED EO 117 THAT NO

[COMPLIES WITH 2004-14 YES YES CONTRIBUTIONS WERE MADE AFTER YES YES YES
11/15/08; REQUEST 2004-14

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK OK OK

QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INLCUDED

LAB

EMSL ANALYTICAL INC. AND QC
LABORATORIES

AQUA PRO-TECH LABORATORIES

ACCUTEST LABORATORIES

INTEGRATED ANALYTICAL LABORATORIES

RESPONDING FOR GEOPHYSICAL, UG
STORAGE TANK INVEST AND
ENVIRONMENTAL DUE DILIGENCE

EMSL ANALYTICAL INC.

KEY PERSONNEL INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
. PE LICENSED THROUGH NJ CONS AFFAIRS, | PE LICENSED THROUGH NJ CONS AFFAIRS 24GE02898100 EXPIRES 4/30/10 FOR
LICENSURE PE'S THROUGH SYNERGY 24GA27990400 24GA27933700 EUGENE GALLAGHER JR.
NELAP ACCREDITATION EMSL AND GC THROUGH NJ DEP NELAC THROUGH NJ DEP NELAC THROUGH NJ DEP NELAP THROUGH NJ DEP NJ CERTIFICATION 04653
ELCP ACCREDITATION
DISCIPLINES PAGE 3 AND 4 SECTION 2, PAGE 1 SECTION 1, PAGE 1 INTRO, PAGE 2 SECTION 12 PAGE 1 AND 2
HILLMAN ENVIRONMENTAL, AURORA
SUBCONTRACTORS SYNERGY ENVIRONMENTAL INC. ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
FEE SHEDULE INLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
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BID RESULTS

AB2009-23B TIMOTHY HAY FOR THE MERCER COUNTY EQUESTRIAN CENTER - RE-BID

AUGUST 20, 2009

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

2

LOW BIDDER

NAME OF BIDDER

DE SANDRE BROS. CO., INC.

S.R. CONRAD & SON

ADDRESS

170 CRANBURY NECK ROAD

240 TOWNSHIP LINE ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP

CRANBURY, NEW JERSEY 08512

HILLSBOROUGH, NJ 08844

CONTACT HENRY DE SANDRE SAMUEL G. CONARD

TELEPHONE 609-799-4441 908-874-5395

FAX 609-799-8784 908-874-8374

WEBSITE HDESANDRE@VERIZON.NET SECONARD@COMCAST.NET
INSURANCE REQUIRED REQUIRED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION X X

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE X X

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE 39050 EXPIRES 1/15/2014 REQUIRES EIC

COST PER BALE 7.55 7.25
TOTAL COST FOR 4,500 BALES 33,975.00 32,625.00
EXCEPTIONS MIN. WEIGHT 53 LBS. PER BALE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NO
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BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2009-23 SOD FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAF

AUGUST 20, 2008

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

MULTIPLE AWARDS BASED UPON LOW BID FOR EACH LINE
ITEM - THE COUNTY WILL FACTOR AN ADDITIONAL $.60 PER
MILE FOR PICK-UP BY THE COUNTY AGENCY

LOW BIDDER WITH MILEAGE FACTOR

NAME OF BIDDER

BARBATO NURSERY CORP.

ANDY-MATT, INC.

EAST COAST SOD LLC

REEDS SOD FARM LLC

ADDRESS

1600 RAILROADD AVE

19 SCRUB OAKS ROAD

596 POINTERS AUBURN RD

1369 OLD YORK ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP

HOLBROOK,NY 11741

MINE HILL, NJ 07803

PILESGROVE, NJ 08098

ALLENTOWN, NJ 08501

CONTACT ANTHONY BARBATO ANDREW BENKENDORF RICHARD DELEA DAVID REED
TELEPHONE 631-285-6767 973-584-6869 631-368-3264 609-259-0775
FAX 631-285-6748 973-584-3819 631-368-3265 609-259-7216
WEBSITE barbatolandscape@aol.com andymattinc@yahoo.com

INSURANCE REQUIRED REQUIRED REQUIRED REQUIRED
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK DID NOT SUBMIT NEED

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE

OK WITH SH'S REFERENCED

OK WITH SH REFERENCED

OK WITH SH REFERENCED

OK WITH SH'S REFERENCED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE 32957 EXPIRATION DATE 8/15/2016 33451 EXPIRATION DATE 1/15/2010 NEED EIC NEED EIC

KENTUCKY BLUEGRASS SOD DELIVERED COST PER SQUARE FT. 0.3 0.26] 0.28] 0.1
E_IiNTUCKY BLUEGRASS SOD PICK-UP BY AGENCY COST PER SQUARE 0.25 0.23 0.22 0.1
BENTGRASS SOD DELIVERED COST PER SQUARE FT. 1.1p 0.74| 1.02 GREENS HEIGHT .62 TEE/FAIRWAY HEIGHT 0.7]
BENTGRASS SOD PICK-UP COST PER SQUARE FT. 0.98 0.68| .87 GREENS HEIGHT .47 TEE/FAIRWAY HEIGHT 0.6)
TALL FESCUE SOD DELIVERED COST PER SQUARE FT. 0.3 0.2 0.2 0.1
TALL FESCUE SOD PICK-UP COST PER SQUARE FT. 0.2 0.1] 0.2p 0.1
FACTOR MILEAGE 34.2 7.2
TOTAL 34.4 7.4
BLUEGRASS/FESCUE MIX SOD DELIVERED COST PER SQUARE FT. 0.3 NO BID 0.3p 0.1]
BLUEGRASS/FESCUE MIX SOD PICK-UP COST PER SQUARE FT. 0.2 NO BID 0.2B 0.1]

PICKUP LOCATION

EAST COAST SOD AND SEED, 596 POINTERS
AUBURN ROAD, PILESGROVE, NJ 08098 = 59.61

301 ROUTE 46, MINE HILL, NJ 07803 = 57.14

EAST COAST SOD AND SEED, 596 POINTERS
AUBURN ROAD, PILESGROVE, NJ 08098 = 59.61

REEDS SOD FARM, 1369 OLD YORK ROAD,
ALLENTOWN, NJ 08501 = 12.04 MILES FROM 640 S.

MILES MILES MILES BROAD STREET

WILL VENDOR EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS YES YES YES YES

TWO PALLET MIN. FOR DELIVERIES, TWO

PALLET MIN. TO EACH DELIVERY SITE, WILL

EXCEPTIONS BE CREDITED UPON RETURN TO EAST COAST NONE NONE NONE

SOD & SEED; PALLET CHARGE $15.00 PER

PALLET

FATAL FLAW NO NO YES - BRC OMITTED NO
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BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2009-24 BUILDING MATERIALS FOR MERCER COUNTY COOP

8/21/2009

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

2

NAME OF BIDDER

Diamond M. Lumber Co.

Bayway Lumber

ADDRESS

1883 Rt. 38

400 Ashton Avenue

CITY, STATE, ZIP

Southhampton, NJ 08088

Linden, NJ 07036

CONTACT

Arthur S. Mach

Tom Sharp

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL

tom.sharp@baywaylumber.com

TELEPHONE 609-261-2701 908-486-4480/908-482-2345

FAX 609-261-2749 908-486-8610

INSURANCE NEED NEED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE #2401 EXPIRATION DATE 8-15-2011 #6904 EXPIR'?—I(;I,IOQN DATE 3-15-

EXHIBIT A YES YES

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE YES, WITH OWNERS REFERENCED YES, WITH OWNERS REFERENCED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK

VENDOR WILL EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS YES YES

EXCEPTIONS YES - CONVERSIONS YES, CONVERSIONS AND REFER TO
PAGE 44

FATAL FLAW NO NO



mailto:tom.sharp@baywaylumber.com�

ITEM COSTPER | COST PER - LOW LOW BID
# DESCRIPTION OF BUILDING MATERIALS UNIT EXCEPTIONS UNIT EXCEPTIONS BIDDER VENDOR
BAYWAY BAYWAY DIAMOND M. DIAMOND M.
ADHESIVES LUMBER LUMBER LUMBER CO. LUMBER CO.
CONV,ERSIO CONVERSION
1 Vinyl Floor Tile Adhesive (Gallon) 9.98] 16.99 9.98
2 Tile Bound Il Wood Glue 1 Gal Bottles 16.67 18.99 16.67
3 Vinyl Cove Base Adhesive, 24- 11 oz Tubes / Cs 25.05 71.76 25.05
4 PL200 Multi-Purpose Adhesive, 12- 11 oz Tubes / Cs 23.70] 34.68 23.70
5 White Late Caulking-, Paintable, 12- 11 oz Tubes / Cs 18.72 23.88 18.72
6 White Silicone Caulking, Paintable, 72- 11 oz- Tubes / 22.35 35.88 22.35
7 Clear Silicone Caulking- 11 oz Tubes, 12 Tubes /Cs 17.75 71.88 17.75
8 Glazing Compound 11 oz. Tubes, 12 Tubes/Cs 20.24 41.88 20.24
9 Patching Cement - 10 Ib containers 10.51 12.80] 10.51
10 |Mortar Mix - 80 Ib bags 5.03 6.45] 5.03
11 |Gravel Mix - 80 Ib bags 4.49 4.60] 4.49
12 |Sand Mix - 80 Ib bags 5.16 5.65) 5.16
13 |Portland Cement - 94 Ib bags 8.44 9.20 8.44
DRYWALL
14 |*Muralo Spackle Lite - 1 gal cans 16.30[ RED DEVIL BRAND 18.99 16.30
SHEETROCK- (EACH) -
15 |4x8x% 5.36) 5.92] 5.36
16 |4x10x% 6.66) 7.40 6.66
17 |4 x8x5/8 6.57| 7.19 6.57
18 |4 x10x5/8 8.21 8.96 8.21
19 |4x12x5/8 9.99 10.78, 9.99
20 |4x12x% 8.33 8.88 8.33
21 |4 x 8 x %2 Moisture Resistant 7.56) 7.96] 7.56
22 |4 x 8 x 5/8 Moisture Restrained 8.13) 9.72 8.13
23 [Spackling Compound- 5 gal pails 14.45 15.80] 14.45
24  |Perforated Spackling Tape / 250’ rolls 1.69 2.69| 1.69
25 1% x 1% x 10" Metal Corner Bead 1.15 2.00 1.15
26 |%2” x 10’ J-Channel, Plastic 1.31 1.20] 1.20
27 15/8” x 10’ J-Channel, Plastic 0.94] 1.30 0.94
STEEL STUD
28 |2x4x8 25GA 1.97] 2.56|3 X 5/8 X 8' 25 GA 1.97
29 |2x4x10 25GA 2.46) 3.20] 3 X5/8 X10'25 2.46
30 [2x4x12' 25GA 2.94] 3.84] 3X5/8X12'25 2.94
3 X 5/8 X 10" Steel
31 |2 x4 x 10’ Steel Sole/Top Plate 25 GA 2.43 3.20| Sole/Top Plate 25 2.43
GA- EA.
, 3X5/8X14'-25
32 [2x4x14-25GA NO BID 4.48 GA - EA 4.48
33 [2x4x8 -20GA 3.02 3.20] 3X5/8 X8 -20 3.02
34 |2x4x10 -20GA 3.78 4.00] 3 X5/8 X10'-20 3.78
35 [2x4x12' -20GA 4.54 4.80/35/8 X 12' - 20 GA 4.54
36 [2x4x14 -20GA 5.29 5.60] 3 X 5/8 X 14' - 20 5.29
37 |2x4x20 20 GA 7.56) 8.00] 3 X 5/8 X 20' 20 7.56
L SHELF BRACKETS (EACH)
38 |12"x 12" 0.92 4.59 0.92
39 [12” x 12” w/Support Arm 3.92 7.99 3.92
40 [12” x 12" w/Support Arm & Closet Pole Holder 2.23] 3.89 2.23
41  [16 x 20 L-Shelf Bracket w/Support Arm 4.93 11.99 4.93
THREADED STEEL RODS - /7 FOOT - CHANGE TO
YARD
42 |va” 0.35 Ya" x 36" 0.39 0.35
43 |3/8” 0.58 3/8” x 36" 0.65 0.58
44 " 0.95 12" x 36" 1.35 0.95
45 |5/16” 0.46 5/16” x 36" 0.45 0.45
ROLL 6 MIL CLEAR PLASTIC
46 |20’ x 100’ 44.85 74.24 44.85
47 |8 x 100 22.62 30.91 22.62
TAPE- (EACH) -
48 [1” x 60 Yds Masking 1.21 1.99 1.21
49 |2" x 60 Yds Masking 2.44] 3.98 2.44
50 [2” Duct 5.42) 3.99 3.99
51 |2” x 60 Yds Blue Painters Tape 7.29 11.60, 7.29
NAILS COMMON - PER 5 LB BOX -
52 |6D 7.35) 5.50 5.50
53 |8D 5.26 5.50 5.26
54 [10D 5.26 5.50 5.26
55 [12D 6.49 5.50] 5.50
56 |12” Galvanized Spikes (50LB) 50.12 69.50 50.12




FINISHING NAILS - PER 5 LB BOX

57 |3D 8.89 7.90] 7.90
58 |4D 8.89 6.90] 6.90
59 |6D 6.93) 6.40] 6.40
60 |8D 8.89 6.40] 6.40
61 (10D 8.01 6.40] 6.40
#2 IDAHO
#2 WHITE PINE - / LF- (EACH) OR PREM
62 |1x2 0.19 0.30 0.19
63 [1x3 0.26 0.40 0.26
64 |1x4 0.26 0.40 0.26
65 |1x6 0.44 0.60 0.44
66 |1x8 0.60 0.80 0.60
67 |1x10 0.70 1.00] 0.70
68 |1x12 1.03) 1.20] 1.03
69 |[5/4x2 NO BID 0.38 0.38
70 |5/4x3 NO BID, 0.53 0.53
71 |5/4x4 NO BID 0.58 0.58
72 _|5/4x6 0.78 0.88 0.78
73 |5/4x8 1.04 1.16 1.04
74 |5/4 x 10 1.30) 1.46| 1.30
75 |5/4x12 1.80 1.75 1.75
PLYSCORE CDX- (EACH) -
76 |4 x8x YL 13.35) 14.72] CDX FIR B 13.35
77 _|4x8x5/8" 16.00] 16.64] CDX FIR B 16.00
78 |4 x 8 x 3" 18.44] 20.16| CDX FIR B 18.44
79 |4 x8xVa” 9.48 12.80] NO CDX CAN USE 9.48
80 |4 x8x3/8" 10.08, 12.80] CDX FIR B 10.08
81 |4x8xw 12.73 14.72] CDX FIR B 12.73
82 |4x8x5/8" 16.00] 16.64] CDX FIR B 16.00
83 |4x8x3 19.16) 20.16 CDX FIR B 19.16
MASONITE TEMPERED HARDBOARD- (EACH) -
84 |4x8x1/8" 6.44] 10.60] 6.44
85 |4 x8xWa 10.40 11.72] 10.40
86 |4 x 8 x ¥4", White 19.00] 16.50| 4 x 8 x 1/8" White 16.50
MASONITE TEMPERED PEG BOARD- (EACH) -
87 |4x8x1/8" NO BID, 12.88] 12.88
88 |4 x8xWa 15.80 14.90, 14.90
PARTICLE BOARD- (EACH)
89 [4x8x5/8" 18.40] 19.52] COMMO'!\IOEENSITY 18.40
90 |4x8x34" 17.60) 24.64 COMMO'!\IO';ENSITY 17.60
91 [4x8x11/8” 29.20 32.64 COMMO'!\IOEENSITY 29.20
92 |4 x 8 x 3” White one side Melamine 23.60 30.72 COMMO'!\IOEENSITY 23.60
93 |4 x 8 x %" White both sides Melamine 26.00] 30.40] 26.00
94 14 x 8 x 12” Homasote 16.13] 4x8x1/2 17.20| 16.13
95 [4 x 8 x ¥4” Luan Plywood 9.48 12.80] 9.48
96 |%2” Partical Board 14.40] 17.60 COMMO'!\IOI;ENSITY 14.40
DOUGLAS FIR - / LF- (EACH)
97 |2x4 0.22 0.30 0.22
98 |2x6 0.38 0.48 0.38
99 [2x8 0.47 0.64 0.47
100 [2x10 0.66 0.89 0.66
101 [2x12 0.79 1.12] #2 and btr 0.79
102 [4x4 0.70 0.88 #2 and btr 0.70
PRESSURE TREATED -/ LF- (EACH) (Must not
contain any CCA)
103 [2x2x4 1.13 1.32 #1 and btr 1.13
104 [2x3 NO BID, 0.38 #2 and btr 0.38
105 [2x4 0.33 0.36 #2 and btr 0.33
106 _[2x6 0.46 0.55 #2 and btr 0.46
107 [2x8 0.66 0.72 #2 and btr 0.66
108 |2 x 10 0.88 0.98 #2 and btr 0.88
109 [2x12 1.31 1.38] #2 and btr 1.31
110 [4x4 0.96 0.88 #2 and btr 0.88
111 [6x6 2.03) 1.98] #2 and btr 1.98
112 |1 x4 Pine # 2 0.20 0.40 0.20
113 |1 x 6 Pine #2 0.32 0.60 0.32
114 |1 x 8 Pine #2 NO BID, 0.80 0.80
115 |5/4 x 6 Pressure Treated Decking 0.64 0.47| 0.47
SPRUCE - / BUNDLE
116 [1x2 12- 12' PCs / Bundle 10.65) 14.95] 10.65
117 |5/4 x 3 8- 12' PCs/ Bundle 12.24] 19.60] 12.24
118 [Bundle of Mason Lath 8.44] 9.60 8.44
119 |Bundle of Cedar Under course Shingles 7.44] 6.50] 6.50




SUSPENDED CEILING ACOUSTICAL TILE /7 Box

31.09

120 |USG # 2310 Auratone, OMNI Fissured 24"x48"x5/8” 36.38] 31.09
121 |(8 PCs/Cs) Square Edge - White NO BID 28.80 2 X4 BX 28.80
122 [3# Roll of T-Bar Wire 2.50 4.89 2.50
123 |2’ T-Bar White (Simplicity), 60 Pcs/Box 1.30] NO BID 1.30
124 |4’ T-Bar White (Simplicity), 60 Pcs/Box 2.59 NO BID 2.59
125 |12’ Heavy Duty 5-Bar White, Simplicity 25 Pcs/Box 7.78] NO BID 7.78
126 |10’ Wall Angle White, Simplicity, 40 PCs / Box 3.58 NO BID 3.58
127 |USG-DX 12’ Main Tee, White 6.75] 7.24 20 PER CTN 6.75
128 |USG-DX 2’ Cross Tee, White 1.16) 1.19 60 PER CTN 1.16
129 |USG-DX 4’ Cross Tee, White 2.46] 2.23] 60 PER CTN 2.23
130 |USG-M-7 12’ Wall Angle, White 3.04 4.64 40 PER CTN 3.04
131 |USG-TS16 Outside Corner, White, 100/Pkg 174.16) 205.00] 174.16
132 |USG-A2 Inside Corner Cap, White, 200/Pkg 313.82 339.00 313.82
133 |USG-AC-M7 Attachment Clip, White, 100/Pkg 95.70] 126.00) 95.70
FINISHES -
134 |Minwax Brand Qil Stain (Asst'd Colors) - / Ot 8.70 8.50) 8.50
135 |Minwax Brand Oil Gloss Polyurethane - / Ot 6.89 12.60] 6.89
136 |Minwax Brand Qil Satin Polyurethane - / Ot 8.52] 12.60] 8.52
137 [Clear Wood Preservative - / Gal. 19.59 13.99 13.99
138 [Paint Thinner - / Gal. 6.36 9.80 6.36
139 [Denatured Alcohol - / Gal. 9.69 12.90] 9.69
140 |Linseed Qil - / Gal. 18.93 23.50 18.93
141 |Paint Remover - / Ga. 18.51] 27.90 18.51
142 |Elmer’s Brand Carpenter’'s Wood Filler - / Pint 3.55 4.95) 3.55
143 |Lacquer Thinner - / Gal. 9.59] 12.95 9.59
SHELF STANDARDS & ARMS- (EACH) -
144 |3’ Shelf Standards Alum Finish 2.34 3.89 2.34
145 |4’ Shelf Standards Alum Finish 2.67 5.19 2.67
146 |6’ Shelf Standards Alum Finish 4.36 7.89 4.36
147 [10” Shelf Arms Alum Finish 1.24 2.98 1.24
148 [12” Shelf Arms Alum Finish 1.33 3.59 1.33
FIR - / LIN FT- (EACH) -
149 1" x 2" NO BID 0.12] HEM FIR #2 BTR 0.12
150 2" x 4” 0.22] 0.30] HEM FIR #2 BTR 0.22
151 |2" x 6” 0.38 0.45| HEM FIR #2 BTR 0.38
152 |2” x 8” 0.47] 0.65| HEM FIR #2 BTR 0.47
153 |2 x 10" 0.66 0.89] HEM FIR #2 BTR 0.66
154 12" x 12" 0.79 1.04[ HEM FIR #2 BTR 0.79
155 [3"x 10" NO BID 2.15] HEM FIR #2 BTR 2.15
156 |3” x 12" NO BID 3.87| HEM FIR #2 BTR 3.87
157 |4"x 4" 0.70 0.88] HEM FIR #2 BTR 0.70
158 |4” x 6” NO BID 2.58| HEM FIR #2 BTR 2.58
159 [3"x 6" NO BID 1.95( HEM FIR #2 BTR 1.95
160 |6” x 6” NO BID 3.90] HEM FIR #2 BTR 3.90
161 Spaffold Planks (OSHA approved)2 x 9 x 10 R/Spruce - / 1.49 LIN. FT. 268 2 X 10 X 10 SPINE 268
Lin Ft FT.
PLYSCORE - / Sheet -
162 |4’ x 8 x 2" 13.35 14.72) CDX 13.35
163 |4’ x 8" x Va” 9.48) 12.80] MAHOGANY 5.2 9.48
164 |4’ x 8 x 5/8” 16.00 16.64] CDX FIR B 16.00
165 [4'x 8 x ¥a” 19.16} 20.16] CDX FIR B 19.16
166 |4’ x 8' x 2" - AC Grade Ext Good on 1 Side 20.20 25.28 20.20
167 |4’ x 8' x 5/8” - AC Grade Ext Good on 1 Side 26.60) 29.44 26.60
168 |4’ x 8' x ¥4" - AC Grade Ext Good on 1 Side 26.60 33.28 26.60
169 [4' X 8' X ¥2" Plywood AC -/Sheet 26.20 25.28 25.28
170 |4’ x 8 x 4" Plywood AC -/Sheet 19.40 19.42) 19.40
171 |4 x 8' x ¥4” Pegboard Temp- /Sheet 15.80 14.90] 14.90
172 |4’ x 8' x Y4 Masonite Std- /Sheet 10.40 11.72) 10.40
DOUBLE HEAD NAILS -
173 |[8P/Lb 1.57 1.30] DUPLEX 1.30
174 |8P /50 Lbs 34.91] 48.00] DUPLEX BX 34.91
175 |10P/Llb 1.57 1.30] DUPLEX 1.30
176 [10P / 50 Lbs 48.04] 48.00] DUPLEX BX 48.00
177 |16P/Llb 1.70] 1.30] DUPLEX 1.30
178 |[16P / 50 Lbs 34.13 48.00] DUPLEX 34.13
COMMON NAILS -
179 [60P/Lb NO BID 1.30] 1.30
180 |60P / 50 Ibs 42.86} 51.00| PER BOX 42.86
181 |[60P Galvanized /Lb NO BID 1.65 1.65
182 |60P Galvanized / 50 Lb 64.09 65.00 PER BOX 64.09
183 [8P/Lb 1.76) 1.00] 1.00
184 |8P /50 Lb 31.85 41.00 PER BOX 31.85
185 [10P/Lb 1.29 1.00] 1.00
186 [10P /50 Lb 42.25 41.00 PER BOX 41.00
187 [16P/Lb 1.37] 1.00] 1.00
188 [16P /50 Lb 34.15 41.00 PER BOX 34.15
189 [20P/Lb 1.37] 1.00] 1.00
190 [20P /50 Lb 36.24] 41.00 PER BOX 36.24




BOX NAILS

1.70

191 [4P/Lb 2.50 1.70]
192 [4P /50 Lb 72.31 65.00 PER BOX 65.00
193 [6P/Lb 2.41) 1.60] 1.60
BRIDGE DIV. -
194 [6P /50 Lb 33.28 42.00 PER BOX 33.28
195 |7P/Lb NO BID, 1.00] 1.00
196 [7P/50Lb 60.80 41.00 PER BOX 41.00
T.H.S
P.K. NAILS TEMPERED -
HARDEN
197 |34 /1lb 1.73 1.75] 1.73
198 3" /50Lb 86.53) 68.00 PER BOX 68.00
199 [1"/Lb 0.91 1.75] 0.91
200 [1"/50Lb 69.23) 68.00 PER BOX 68.00
201 [1%%"/Lb 1.83) 1.75] 1.75
202 [1%"/50Lb 69.23 68.00 PER BOX 68.00
203 [2"/Lb 1.73 1.75] 1.73
204 |27 /50 Lb 69.23) 68.00 PER BOX 68.00
205 [2%2"/Lb 2.02] 1.75] 1.75
206 |2 %" /50 Lb 69.23 68.00 PER BOX 68.00
207 [Mason Lath - / Bundle 8.78 9.60 8.78
208 |2” x 2” x 5' Lengths-Pointed Ends (for stakes)- /Stake 1.43 3.39 1.43
CONCRETE EXPANSION MATERIAL -
ASPHALT IMPREGNATED -
209 |4 x 10" x ¥2" 2.78 26.75 2.78
210 [6" x 10’ x 15" 6.50) NO BID 6.50
CONCRETE NAILS -
211 (1" /1lb NO BID, 1.70] 1.70
212 [1"/50Lb NO BID 65.00 PER BOX 65.00
213 [2"/Llb 3.37 1.70] 1.70
214 12" /50 Lb 83.75 65.00 PER BOX 65.00
215 [3"/Llb 2.55) 1.70] 1.70
216 [3"/50Lb 74.98) 65.00 PER BOX 65.00
217 |4"/1lb NO BID, 1.70] 1.70
218 (4" /50 Lb 108.76 65.00 PER BOX 65.00
219 |PVC Pipe 4" - / Foot 1.81] 0.66 0.66
220 |Plastic 20" x 100’ x 6 Mil 44.85 74.24 44.85
221 |Plastic 10’ x 100’ x 6 Mil 17.67| 37.12 17.67
222 |Set 45, 50 Lb Bags, Fast Setting Cement- / 50 Lb 5.20] 62.50 5.20
223 |Cork Sheets, 4’ x 8 x 3/8” - / Sheet 106.60 88.80 88.80
CCA LUMBER- (EACH) LN FT. -
Loy gm 3/4 x 4 #2
224 |Y2" x 4 NO BID 0.32 COMMON & BTR 0.32
- 3/4 x 6 #2
225 |Y%2"x 6 NO BID 0.48 COMMON & BTR 0.48
ROUGH CUT OAK PLANKS- (EACH) -
226 |2"x 7 Y2" x 14’ 16.38 33.60 16.38
227 2" x 72" x 16’ 18.73 38.40 18.73
228 (2 V%" x 12" x 14’ 31.66 75.60 31.66
229 (2" x 12" x 16’ 36.18 86.40 36.18
230 [2"x 6" x 12 10.53 21.60 10.53
231 [2"x 6" x 14" 12.29 25.20 12.29
232 |2"x 6 x 16" 14.04] 28.80 14.04
233 [1-1/2" x 4" x 12’ 5.27 14.40 5.27
234 |Dressed Square Hubs made of Oak 1 34 x 1 34 x 12”7 NO BID 2.10] 2.10
235 |Dressed Square Wedge 1 5/8 x 1 5/8 x 12” NO BID 1.60 1.60
Solid Southern Yellow Pine Pressure Treated with .40 6 x 12 PT SPINE
236 |[C.C.A. Preservative that matches the strength NO BID| 7.26|#2 & BTR .40 RET. 7.26
requirements for Glue Laminated Douglas Fir 6” x 12" 8' TO 16'LFT.
ADHESIVE -
237 |[36- Titebond Construction ADH 2902 NO BID| 3.95 3.95
MISCELLANEOUS -
238 [5-Packs Red Fuel Cell IMP(2-Packs per) NO BID 13.99 13.99
239 |5- General Purpose Blade 7 ¥4” NO BID 5.99 5.99
MASONRY: CULTURED STONE MATERIAL -
240 |[2- Mortar Type “N” Bags (50 Cube) NO BID 6.25 80LBS. PREPARED 6.25
241 |2- 5 Gallons of Thorobond 22.18] 98.90] 22.18
MISCELLANEOUS
% Up-Charge to Wholesale for Materials that are not
242 referenced 30% 20%




BID RESULTS

AB2009-24B CLOTHING FOR THE MERCER COUNTY CORRECTION CENTER

August 20, 2009

TERM: THROUGH 7/16/11 TO COINCIDE WITH 2009-24,
DELIVERY WITHIN 30 DAYS ARO, COVERALLS:
65P/35C; ORANGE T-SHIRTS 50/50 AND BOXER
SHORTS 60

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

7

INAME OF RESPONDENT

MAR-VEL INTERNATIONAL INC.

0O.D. TARAGIN & BROS. LLC

UNIFORMS MANUFACTURING, INC.

BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.

ROBINSON TEXTILES

THE LIBERTY STORE

CAROLINA TEXTILES

[ADDRESS 7115 AIRPORT HWY. 1400 ALICEANNA STREET PO BOX 12716 134 N. MAIN STREET 152 W. WALNUT STREET, STE. 250 5 EAST GENESEE STREET PO BOX 11211
cITY, STATE, IP PENNSAUKEN, NJ 08109 BALTIMORE, MD 21231 SCOTTSDALE, AZ 85267 FUQUAY VARINA, NC 27526 GARDENA, CA 90248 AUBURN, NY 13021 CHARLOTTE, NC 28220
[CONTACT CHRIS JOHNSON JOHATHAN SHAPIRO SUSAN POLO TINA MORGAN JENNIE KUTSCH MARTY GOLDMAN BOB JONES
[TELEPHONE 856 488 4499 EXT. 108 410 276 7570 480 368 9316 800 334 9880 1-800-421-5582 315252 1761 704 525 1272
FAX 856 448 4343 410 276 1414 480 368 8556 800 322 7537 1-310-353-4218 315 252 1761 704 525 0607
WEBSITE OR E-MAIL CIOHNSON@MAR-VEL.COM ODTAR@EROLS.COM LARRY@UMIDIRECT.COM TINAMORGAN@BOBBARKER.COM JENNIKUTSCH@AOL.COM MARTY@THELIBERTYSTORE.COM CAROLINATEXTILES@NETZERO.COM
|ADDENDUM NO. 1 RECEIVED RECEIVED AND DATED RECEIVED AND DATED RECEIVED AND DATED RECEIVED AND DATED RECEIVED AND DATED RECEIVED AND DATED DID NOT ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM
INSURANCE NEED IF AWARDED 38162 EXPIRES 2/15/13 NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERT 39745 EXPIRES 4/15/14 OK OK 6211 EXPIRES 12/15/09 7048 EXPIRES 3/15/13 28249 EXPIRES 4/15/14 OK
EXHIBIT A oK OK oK OK OK OK oK
|STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK OK OK OK OK OK OK
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION oK YES YES OK OK OK YES
I%zn;:r\égﬁgxemus. COMPLY WITH FABRIC 65% POLY DOZEN NO BID R::ssg: :Zﬁﬂ.ﬁfﬁ;?gf&iﬂ” NO BID
5X 75| 137.52 10,314.00] 156.00 11,700.00] 133.20 9,990.00|  143.00 10,725.00| 142.08 10,656.00|
6X 30| - 14252 4,275.60]  156.00 4,680.00] 133.20 3,996.00] 143.00 4,200.00) 142.08 4,262.40)
7x 30| -| 15652 4,695.60]  156.00 4,680.00| 133.20 3,996.00]  144.00 4,320.00 155.28 4,658.40|
8 15| -| 17052 2,557.80]  156.00 2,340.00]  147.60 2,21400| 144.00 2,160.00) 168.48 2,527.20)
ox 4| -| 18652 746.08| 156.00 624.00[ 147.60 59040  144.00 576.00| 181.68 726.72)
10 4 -| 20640 825.60] 156.00 624.00] 161.28 645.12)  144.00 576.00| 190.87 763.48
11X 4| 218.40 873.60] 156.00 624.00| 173.28 693.12  144.00 576.00) 198.87 795.48)
STENCILING "CORRECTION CENTER" BACK 162| - 12.00 194400 420 680.40| 6.00 972.00| 5.40 874.80) 12.00 1,944.00|
[TOTAL COST FOR COVERALLS (IF COMPLIANT) 26,232.28) 25,952.40) 23,096.64) 24,097.80) 26,333.68)
;;I/;Lgc\;\ngngRALLS COMPLY WITH FABRIC 65% POLY DOZEN NO BID RBE:EEET:_G»;Z(:;;,G’:‘\é:gVE;RE%M NO BID
2x 4 125.42 501.68| 135.00 540.00] 120.00 480.00)  134.00 536.00| 124.87 499.48|
3x 4 5| 13742 549.68| 142.00 568.00| 120.00 480.00)  138.00 552.00| 135.47 541.88|
lax 4 - 14042 561.68] 149.00 596.00| 120.00 480.00)  140.00 560.00] 135.47 541.88)
5% 4 S| 14842 593.68| 156.00 624.00] 136,56 54624  143.00 572.00| 142.03 568.12)
6X 2| -] 15042 300.84] 156.00 312.00] 136,56 273.12)  143.00 286.00| 142.03 284.06]
7x 4| -] 18642 665.68] 156.00 624.00|  136.56 546.24|  144.00 576.00| 155.23 620.92]
8 1] 179.84 179.84| 156.00 156.00| 147.60 147.60]  144.00 144.00| 168.43 168.43
[STENCILING "CORRECTION CENTER" BACK 23] - 36.00 828.00]  12.60 289.80| 6.00 13800  18.00 414.00) 12.00 276.00f
[TOTAL COST FOR COVERALLS (IF COMPLIANT) 4,181.08| 3,709.80] 3,091.20| 3,640.00] 3,500.77]
IT-SHIRTS: COMPLY WITH FABRIC 50% POLY 50% COTTON RONEOMEFIEN[DoR/AsCnonel LOW BID T-SHIRTS

FACTOR IN
5X 50| 39.87] 1,993 50| 4030 2,01500( 4135 2,067.50] 44.28 2,21400(  44.90 2,24500]  37.95 189750 3845 1,922.50|
6X 25| 42.22] 1,055.50] 42.80 1,070.00] 4380 1,00500]  49.44 1,236.00]  46.90 117250 4140 1,035.00] 4065 1,016.25|
7x 25| 44.57) 1,114.25| 49.30 123250 4624 1156000 5496 137400 49.90 124750 4715 1178.75| 4285 1,071.25|
8 15| 46.97] 704.55| 53.30 799.50(  48.68 730.20)  61.92 928.80]  52.90 79350] 5175 776.25] 4285 642.75|
X 15 5059 758.85| 57.60 864.00( 5112 766.80|  68.16 102240 54.90 82350  56.35 845.25|  45.05 675.75]
10 15| 5531 829.65| 62.00 930.00(  53.56 803.40)  73.44 10160  56.90 853.50]  59.80 897.00]  45.05 675.75|
[TOTAL COST FOR T-SHIRTS (IF COMPLIANT) 6,456.30) 6,911.00| 6,618.90| 7,876.80] 7,135.50] 6,629.75| 6,004.25|
BOXERS: COMPLY WITH FABRIC 50% POLY 50% COTTON LOW BID BOXERS
LARGE 500]  12.66] 6,330.00| 1584 7,920.00  13.70 6,850.00| 13.49| 674500 1575 787500 1323 661500 13,09 6,545.00|
XL 500 12.66] 6,330.00| 15.84 7,920.00  13.70 6,850.00| 13.49| 674500 1575 7,875.00 1323 661500 1309 6,545.00|
2xL 500 13.71] 6,855.00| 16.96 8,480.00] 1424 7,120.00| 14.97) 7,48500  16.75 837500 1438 7,190.00]  14.19 7,095.00|
3xL s00|  14.33 7,165.00| 18.10 9,050.00(  14.24 7,120.00| 16.88| 844000  17.75 887500 1553 7,765.00 1419 7,095.00|
laxL 100|  16.26] 1,626.00| 19.30 193000 1424 1,424.00| 18.94] 189400 1875 187500  16.68 1,668.00] 1509 1,529.00|
5XL so|  16.26] 813.00| 2044 1,022.00  17.06 853.00  20.83 104150 1975 987.50]  17.25 862.50] 1520 764.50|
6XL 30| 19.49| 584.70| 21.64 649.20]  20.11 603.30]  24.71] 741.30] 2075 622.50| 18.40 552.00]  16.39 491.70|
7L 30| 19.9| 584.70| 2288 686.40]  20.11 603.30]  24.71] 74130] 2275 682.50] 1955 586.50]  16.39 491.70|
8xL 15| 2113 316.95| 25.80 387.00]  21.80 327.00  24.71] 37065 2475 37125  20.70 31050]  16.39 245.85|
oxL 15| 21.13] 316.95| 28.10 421.50]  21.80 327.00]  24.71] 37065  26.75 401.25] 2185 327.75] 1639 245.85|
10xL 15| 2113 316.95| 31.00 465.00]  23.14 347.10]  26.89 40335 2875 431.25] 2300 34500 16.39 245.85|
[TOTAL COST FOR BOXERS (IF COMPLIANT) 31,239.25| 38,931.10| 32,424.70| 34,977.75| 38,371.25) 32,837.25| 31,294.45|
EXCEPTIONS YES '.;‘&Nyﬁgrzgéggbzgms > MATH ERROR BOXERS NO YES- COVE;’;“‘;?OA\;'/E:KESLWERV MAY) NO NO NO
EATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO NO DID NOT ACKNOWLEDGE ADDENDUM

23,006.64

3,001.20

6,618.90

31,239.25
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RFP RESULTS

CC2009-04 MEDICAL AND MENTAL HEALTH SERVICES FOR THE COUNTY CORRECTION AND YOUTH DETENTION CENTER

8/21/2009

NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS

2

NAME OF RESPONDENT

CFG HEALTH SYSTEMS, LLC

CORRECTIONAL HEALTH SERVICES, LLC

ADDRESS

765 EAST RTE. 70, SUITE A101, BUILDING
A100

WEBSTER COMMONS, 271 GROVE AVENUE,
BUILDING E

CITY, STATE, ZIP

MARLTON, NJ 08053

VERONA, NJ 07044-1730

CONTACT

LES PASCHALL, CEO

GEOFFREY S. PERSELAY

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL

WWW.CFGHEALTHSYSTEMS.COM

PERSELGP@ASGR.COM

TELEPHONE

856 797 4803

973 571 9550

FAX

856 797 4813

973 571 9747

INSURANCE 1 AND 2MM GL, 1MM AUTO, 1 AND 3MM
PROF LIAB REQUIRED

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

ADDENDUM NO. 1

RECEIVED AND DATED 8/7/09

RECEIVED AND DATED 8/10/09

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE

32347 EXPIRES 5/15/11

11495 EXPIRES 7/15/12

EXHIBIT A

INCLUDED

INCLUDED

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE

INCLUDED WITH 100% SH REFERENCED AND
DOCUMENT SIGNED

INCLUDED WITH 100% SH REFERENCED AND
DOCUMENT SIGNED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION INCLUDED DID NOT INCLUDE

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY SECTION 1 INCLUDED IN PREFACE

REFRENCES INCLUDED - WARDEN TO CHECK INCLUDED - WARDEN TO CHECK
QUALIFICATION STATEMENT INCLUDED INCLUDED

EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE

FATAL FLAW NO NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION NOT INCLUDED



http://www.cfghealthsystems.com/�
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MENTAL HEALTH PROPOSAL

CFG HEALTH SYSTEMS, LLC*INCLUDED RELATIVE COST FACTORS

CORRECTIONAL HEALTH SERVICES, LLC

YEAR ONE HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR CFG YEAR ONE HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR| ANNUAL RATE
SW, BS 35 29.30 1,025.50 52 53,326.00 |SW, BS 35 24.99 874.65 52 45,481.80
SW, MSW 35 37.92 1,327.20 52 69,014.40 |SW, MSW 35 38.86 1,360.10 52 70,725.20
PSYCHOL 35 74.31 2,600.85 52 135,244.20 |PSYCHOL 35 105.89 3,706.15 52 192,719.80
PSYCH 15 131.58 1,973.70 52 102,632.40 |PSYCH 15 165.86 2,487.90 52 129,370.80
SW, BS PT 15 31.74 476.10 52 24,757.20 |SW, BS PT 15 24,99 374.85 52 19,492.20
TOTAL YEAR ONE 384,974.20 |[TOTAL YEAR ONE 457,789.80
YEAR TWO HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR[ ANNUAL RATE YEAR TWO HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR| ANNUAL RATE
SW, BS 35 30.18 1,056.30 52 54,927.60 |SW, BS 35 25.65 897.75 52 46,683.00
SW, MSW 35 39.06 1,367.10 52 71,089.20 |SW, MSW 35 40.37 1,412.95 52 73,473.40
PSYCHOL 35 76.54 2,678.90 52 139,302.80 |PSYCHOL 35 109.19 3,821.65 52 198,725.80
PSYCH 15 135.53 2,032.95 52 105,713.40 |PSYCH 15 170.27 2,554.05 52 132,810.60
SW, BS PT 15 32.69 490.35 52 25,498.20 |SW, BS PT 15 25.65 384.75 52 20,007.00
TOTAL YEAR TWO 396,531.20 |[TOTAL YEAR TWO 471,699.80
YEAR THREE HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR[ ANNUAL RATE YEAR THREE HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR| ANNUAL RATE
SW, BS 35 31.09 1,088.15 52 56,583.80 |SW, BS 35 26.33 921.55 52 47,920.60
SW, MSW 35 40.23 1,408.05 52 73,218.60 |SW, MSW 35 42.01 1,470.35 52 76,458.20
PSYCHOL 35 78.83 2,759.05 52 143,470.60 |PSYCHOL 35 112.65 3,942.75 52 205,023.00
PSYCH 15 139.60 2,094.00 52 108,888.00 |PSYCH 15 174.78 2,621.70 52 136,328.40
SW, BS PT 15 33.67 505.05 52 26,262.60 |SW, BS PT 15 26.33 394.95 52 20,537.40
TOTAL YEAR THREE 408,423.60 486,267.60
GRAND TOTAL MENTAL HEALTH 1,189,929.00 |GRAND TOTAL MENTAL HEALTH 1,415,757.20
MEDICAL HEALTH PROPOSAL
CFG HEALTH SYSTEMS, LLC CHS
YEAR ONE HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR CFG YEAR ONE HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR| ANNUAL RATE
MED DIR 35 112.80 3,948.00 52 205,296.00 |MED DIR 35 115.17 4,030.95 52 209,609.40
ADMIN 35 57.10 1,998.50 52 103,922.00 JADMIN 35 43.63 1,527.05 52 79,406.60
ASS'T ADMIN 35 41.00 1,435.00 52 74,620.00 |ASS'T ADMIN 35 25.33 886.55 52 46,100.60
NURSE PRAC 35 65.50 2,292.50 52 119,210.00 |NURSE PRAC 35 74.16 2,595.60 52 134,971.20
UTILIZATION REV 25,000.00 JUTILIZATION REV
YDC CONSULT YDC CONSULT
ADMIN COSTS 107,098.00 |JADMIN COSTS 119,064.00
TOTAL YEAR ONE 635,146.00 |[TOTAL YEAR ONE 589,151.80
YEAR ONE HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR CFG YEAR TWO HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR| ANNUAL RATE
MED DIR 35 116.20 4,067.00 52 211,484.00 |MED DIR 35 118.67 4,153.45 52 215,979.40
ADMIN 35 58.80 2,058.00 52 107,016.00 JADMIN 35 45.35 1,587.25 52 82,537.00
ASS'T ADMIN 35 42.20 1,477.00 52 76,804.00 |ASS'T ADMIN 35 26.59 930.65 52 48,393.80
NURSE PRAC 35 67.50 2,362.50 52 122,850.00 |NURSE PRAC 35 76.64 2,682.40 52 139,484.80
UTILIZATION REV 25,750.00 JUTILIZATION REV
YDC CONSULT YDC CONSULT
ADMIN COSTS 110,311.00 JADMIN COSTS 124,692.00
TOTAL YEAR TWO 654,215.00 |JTOTAL YEAR TWO 611,087.00
YEAR THREE HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR CFG YEAR THREE HRS/WK RATE WEEK WKS/YR| ANNUAL RATE
MED DIR 35 119.70 4,189.50 52 217,854.00 |MED DIR 35 122.37 4,282.95 52 222,713.40
ADMIN 35 60.60 2,121.00 52 110,292.00 JADMIN 35 47.22 1,652.70 52 85,940.40
ASS'T ADMIN 35 43.50 1,522.50 52 79,170.00 JASS'T ADMIN 35 27.99 979.65 52 50,941.80
NURSE PRAC 35 69.50 2,432.50 52 126,490.00 |NURSE PRAC 35 79.29 2,775.15 52 144,307.80
UTILIZATION REV 26,523.00 |UTILIZATION REV
YDC CONSULT YDC CONSULT
ADMIN COSTS 113,620.00 JADMIN COSTS 130,602.00
TOTAL YEAR THREE 673,949.00 |[TOTAL YEAR THREE 634,505.40
GRAND TOTAL MEDICAL HEALTH 1,963,310.00 1,834,744.20
CFG HEALTH SYSTEMS, LLC CORRECTION HEALTH SERVICES
MENTAL HEALTH 1,189,929.00 |[MENTAL HEALTH 1,415,757.20
MEDICAL HEALTH 1,963,310.00 |MEDICAL HEALTH 1,834,744.20
TOTAL 3,153,239.00 |TOTAL 3,250,501.40
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