
NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 4
THE AWARDED CONTRACTOR SHALL INVOICE THE COUNTY 
BASED UPON THE DAILY JOURNAL OF COMMERCE 
PHILADELPHIA TANK CAR LOW PRICE PLUS THE DELIVERY 

LOW BIDDER

NAME OF BIDDER MAJESTIC OIL CO., INC RIGGINS, INC. TAYLOR OIL COMPANY, INC. ALLIED OIL, LLC NO BID

ADDRESS 2104 FAIRFAX AVENUE P.O. BOX 150 77 SECOND STREET 25 OLD CAMPLAIN ROAD VALLEY OIL

CITY, STATE, ZIP CHERRY HILL, NEW JERSEY 08003 MILLVILLE, NEW JERSEY 08332 SOMERVILLE, NEW JERSEY 08876 HILLSBOROUGH, NEW JERSEY 08844 P.O. BOX 245

CONTACT GENE RAYMOND, IV R. PAUL RIGGINS FRANK T. BLOOM ROBERT GOLFSTEIN HOPEWELL, NJ

TELEPHONE 856-751-8801 856-825-7600 908-725-9200 908-575-7577

FAX 856-751-8824 856-825-2270 908-725-4600 908-575-8833

WEBSITE MAJESTICOIL@COMCAST.NET RPRIGGINS@RIGGINSOIL.COM FBLOOM@TAYLOROILCOM JMARQUEZ@ALLIEDOILCO.COM OR 
RGOLDSTEIN@ALLIEDOILCO.COM

INSURANCE NEED NEED NEED REQUIRED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE OK WITH SH'S REFERENCED OK WITH DISCLOSURE ATTACHED OK WITH SH'S REFERENCED OK WITH DISCLOSURE ATTACHED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE 7090 EXPIRATION DATE 3/15/2013 2940 EXPIRATION DATE 11/15/2010 4357 EXPIRATION DATE 8-15-2012 2483 EXPIRATION DATE 12-15-2011

YEAR ONE 

PHILADELPHIA TANK CAR PRICE 1.9275 1.9275 1.9275 1.9275

FIXED DELIVERY AND OTHER CHARGES PER GALLON 0.1276 0.12 0.2500 0.2320

TOTAL PRICE DELIVERED PER GALLON 2.0551 2.0475 2.1775 2.1595

TOTAL YEAR ONE 241,604 GALLONS                                                      496,520.3804                                                      494,684.1900                                                      526,092.7100                                                      521,743.8380 

YEAR TWO

1.9275 1.9275 1.9275 1.9275

FIXED DELIVERY AND OTHER CHARGES PER GALLON 0.1276 0.12 0.2500 0.2480

TOTAL PRICE DELIVERED PER GALLON 2.0551 2.0475 2.1775 2.1755

TOTAL PRICE DELIVERED 241,604                                                      496,520.3804                                                      494,684.1900                                                      526,092.7100                                                      525,609.5020 

GRAND TOTAL TWO YEARS                                                      993,040.7608                                                      989,368.3800                                                   1,052,185.4200                                                   1,047,353.3400 

WILL VENDOR EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS  YES  YES  YES  YES 

EXCEPTIONS  NO  NO  NO  NO 

FATAL FLAW  NO  NO  NO  NO 

BID RESULTS
CK09MERCER2009-22 FUEL OIL #2 FOR A PERIOD OF TWO YEARS

AUGUST 27, 2009
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CONTRACT TERM: 2 YEARS

NUMBER OF BIDDERS 8 LOW BID PM 
NAME OF BIDDER MIDDLETOWN SPRINKLER COMPANY, INC. JERSEY SHORE LAWN SPRINKLER, INC. A.C. SCHULTES, INC. GEORGE E. LEY COMPANY

ADDRESS 326 ROUTE 36 870 ROUTE 530 664 S. EVERGREEN AVENUE 130 DEVEREUX ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP PORT MONMOUTH, NJ 07758 WHITING, NJ 08759 WOODBURY HEIGHTS, NJ 08097 GLENMOORE, PA 19343

CONTACT ROBERT DOBSON ANTHONY SIRCHIO AUGUST C. SCHULTES, IV GEORGE E. LEY III

TELEPHONE 732 787 1700 732 270 0072 856 845 5656 610 942 3809

FAX 732 505 6003 856 845 1335 610 942 9556

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL ASIRCHIO@YAHOO.COM GOSIV@ASCHULTES.COM GOLFINFO@FELCOGOLF.COM

EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS NO YES YES YES

INSURANCE REQUIRED REQUIRED REQUIRED REQUIRED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE EXHIBIT B; REQUIRES AA201 REQUIRED REQUIRED REQUIRED REQUIRED

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT OK OK OK OK

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION FOR GC OK OK OK OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE SIGNED WITH SH REFERENCED SINCE 1984 SIGNED WITH SH REFERENCED SINCE 1990 SIGNED WITH SH REFERENCED SINCE 1984 SIGNED WITH SH REFERENCED SINCE 1988

EQUIPMENT CERT OK OK OK OK

FIVE YEARS EXPERIENCE YES YES YES YES

EXECUTIVE ORDERS AND RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR POLICY SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED SIGNED

PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION FOR GC 607255 EXPIRES 10/14/09 632592 EXPIRES 9/8/11 48148 EXPIRES 3/24/11 616888 EXPIRES 4/15/10

LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION LICENSE FROM DEP IN-HOUSE 0016681 IN-HOUSE 0015043 EXPIRES 1/31/11 0015602 EXPIRES 1/31/11

PUMP INSTALLATION LICENSE FROM DEP IN-HOUSE PI0014 IN-HOUSE 0015722 EXPIRES 6/30/11 TIGER CONSTRUCTION 0001644 MASTER WELL 
DRILLER

WELL DRILLER PICKWICK WELL DRILLING M13762 IN-HOUSE 0001436 EXPIRES 6/30/11 
JOURNEYMAN 0001678 EXPIRES 6/30/11 TIGER CONSTRUCTION 0001644 MASTER WELL 

DRILLER
BRC FOR WELL INSTALLER OK IN-HOUSE INCLUDED FROM TIGER CONSTRUCTION

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION FOR WELL INSTALLER 604862 EXPIRES 7/10/2010 IN-HOUSE 65883 EXPIRES 5/5/11

REFERENCES JAY LONG TO CHECK JAY LONG TO CHECK JAY LONG TO CHECK JAY LONG TO CHECK

HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR AND PM FOR IRRIGATION SYSTEMS                                                                          78.00                                                                          84.00                                                                        125.00 

ALL INCLUSIVE PM BASED UPON LUMP SUM FOR PM FOR PUMPS AND 
WELLS                                                                   27,300.00                                                                   80,000.00  DID NOT PROVIDE A LUMP SUM                                                                   14,000.00 

RATE FOR ABOVE WORK (AWARD BASED UPON LS)                                                                        118.00                                                                        124.00                                                                        144.50                                                                        135.00 

MAKRUP TO WHOLESALE PART AND SUPPLIES:

TORO 20% 40% NO BID 15%

RAINBIRD 20% 40% NO BID 15%

HUNTER 20% 40% NO BID 15%

EXCEPTIONS  LUMP SUM EXCLUDES PARTS AND EQUIPMENT  NONE 
BIDDING ON WELL, PUMP AND MOTOR WORK 
ONLY; BID PER 2 MAN CREW AT $289.00 PER 

HOUR 
 NONE 

FATAL FLAW NO NO DID NOT PROVIDE A LUMP SUM FOR PM FOR 
PUMP AND WELL WORK NO

CK09MERCER2009-15 IRRIGATION SYSTEM, FOUNTAIN, PUMP HOUSE REPAIR AND PM
BID RESULTS

August 28, 2009
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CHECK LICENSE EXPIRATION DATE LOW BID IRRIGATION AND PARTS
NAME OF BIDDER IRRIGATION SYSTEMS, INC. QUALITY CUT INC.

ADDRESS 936 FAIRMOUNT STREET PO BOX 391

CITY, STATE, ZIP CAMDEN, NJ 08104 FARMINGDALE, NJ 07727

CONTACT JOSEPH SEWARD DOUGLAS MCGEE

TELEPHONE 856 541 8222 732 901 7776

FAX 856 541 0359 732 901 7776

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL IRRIGATIONS6STEMS@VERIZON.NET QUALITYCUTINC@YAHOO.COM

EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS YES YES

INSURANCE REQUIRED REQUIRED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE EXHIBIT B; REQUIRES AA201 REQUIRED REQUIRED

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT OK

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION FOR GC OK OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE SIGNED WITH SH REFERENCED SINCE 1979 SIGNED WITH SH REFERENCED SINCE 1997

EQUIPMENT CERT OK OK

FIVE YEARS EXPERIENCE YES YES

EXECUTIVE ORDERS AND RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR POLICY SIGNED SIGNED COMPLYING WITH PW AND PW

PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION FOR GC 643608 EXPIRES 3/21/11 661983 EXPIRES 2/4/10

LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION LICENSE IN-HOUSE 0015861 EXPIRES 1/31/09 IN-HOUSE 0021966 EXPIRES 1/31/10

PUMP INSTALLATION LICENSE A.C. SCHULTES 0001678 EXPIRES 6/30/11 NO BID

WELL INSTALLATION LICENSE A.C. SCHULTES 0001678 EXPIRES 6/30/11 NO BID

BRC FOR WELL INSTALLER INCLUDED FROM A.C. SCHULTES, INC.

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION FOR WELL INSTALLER 48148 EXPIRES 3/24/11

REFERENCES INCLUDED JAY LONG TO CHECK INCLUDED JAY LONG TO CHECK

HOURLY RATE FOR REPAIR AND PM FOR IRRIGATION SYSTEMS                                                                          75.00                                                                          61.50 

ALL INCLUSIVE BASED UPON LUMP SUM FOR PM FOR PUMPS AND 
WELLS 2 YEARS  DID NOT PROVIDE LUMP SUM  NO BID 

RATE FOR ABOVE WORK (AWARD BASED UPON LS)                                                                          90.00 

PART AND SUPPLIES:

TORO 0% 0%

RAINBIRD 0% 0%

HUNTER 0% 0%

EXCEPTIONS  DID NOT PROVIDE LUMP SUM FOR PM FOR 
PUMPS AND WELLS  NONE 

FATAL FLAW NO NO
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NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 2

 THREE YEAR CONTRACT 

NAME OF RESPONDENT BILCAR 2 ENTERPRISES, LLC GOLD CHEF SERVICES, LLC

ADDRESS 17 BLACKWOOD DRIVE 225 PASSAIC STREET

CITY, STATE, ZIP WEST TRENTON, NJ 08628 PASSAIC, NJ 07055

CONTACT SUZANNE ADAMS DOMINIC CERTO

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL THERUNWAYONLINE@YAHOO.COM DCERTO@GOLDCHEFSERVICES.COM

TELEPHONE 908 227 1816 973 859 2880

FAX 908 450 3111

INSURANCE 1 AND 2 MM GL REQUIRED REQUIRED

ADDENDUM NO. 1 RECEIVED AND DATED 8/6/09 RECEIVED AND DATED 8/20/09

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE NEED EIC NEED EIC

EXHIBIT A INSERT INSERT

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE COMPLETED WITH SH AND SIGNED COMPLETED WITH SH AND SIGNED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION RECEIVED RECEIVED

METHOD OF OPERATION INCLUDED INCLUDED

MENU INCLUDED INCLUDED

REFERENCES INCLUDED INCLUDED

EXCEPTIONS NONE
YES - TO INSTALL VENTLESS GRILL AND 

ODORLESS COOKING EQUIPMENT

FATAL FLAW NO NO

RFP RESULTS
CC2009-03 CAFETERIA SERVICES FOR THE MERCER COUNTY ADMINISTRATION BUILDING

8/28/2009
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