
NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 4

CONTRACT PERIOD ONE YEAR WITH OPTION TO EXTEND 
ONE YEAR BASED UPON INDEX RATE; SUBCONTRACTORS 
NOT PERMISSIVE

NAME OF BIDDER
ALTERNATIVE MICROGRAPHICS, 

INC.
FW DUTTON, INC. T/A PMI 

TECHNOLOGIES
LARGEDOC SOLUTIONS ACES IMAGING SYSTEMS

ADDRESS 704 CHALLENGER WAY 1931 OLNEY AVENUE, SUITE 600 15 WALNUT AVENUE PO BOX 1506

CITY, STATE, ZIP FORKED RIVER, NJ 08731 CHERRY HILL, NJ 08003 CLARK, NJ 07066 MT. LAUREL, NJ 08054

CONTACT JAMES THOMS FRANK DUTTON GARY STARK RON FRIEDMAN

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL MICRO999@AOL.COM INFO@PMITECHNOLOGIES.COM GSTARK@LARGDOC.COM RODRIED@COMCAST.NET

TELEPHONE 609 971 7766 800 750 0110 732-598-3090 856 727 5015

FAX 609 971 0883 856 470 1359 732-882-1220 856 727 7813

INSURANCE 1/2MM GL AND 1M AUTO REQUIRED FROM LOW 
BIDDERS

NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED INCLUDED NEED IF AWARDED

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION OK OK OK OK

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE SIGNED WITH SH'S REFERENCED SIGNED WITH SH REFERENCED SIGNED WITH SH'S REFERENCED SIGNED WITH SH'S

EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERT 19977 EXPIRES 2016 37428 EXPIRES 2012 EXPIRES 5/15/2010 16122 EXPIRES 2015

EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS YES YES YES YES

ADDENDUM NO. 1 RECEIVED AND SIGNED RECEIVED AND SIGNED RECEIVED AND SIGNED RECEIVED AND DATED

NARRATIVE APPROACH AND CAMERA INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

SUBMIT REEL OF MICROFILM INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

SUBMIT PROJECT PLAN INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

SUBMIT EXPERIENCE INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

SUBMIT THREE REFERENCES INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED

DOC PREP

PRICE PER PAGE  N/C                                                  0.083                                                  0.010                                                                    0.005 

TOTAL PAGES                                            1,200,000                                            1,200,000                                            1,200,000                                                              1,200,000 

TOTAL COST N/C                                            99,600.00                                            12,000.00                                                                6,000.00 

FILMING BOUND BOOKS

PRICE PER IMAGE SILVER HALIDE                                                  0.040                                                  0.020                                                  0.070                                                                    0.120 

TOTAL IMAGES                                            1,200,000                                            1,200,000                                            1,200,000                                                              1,200,000 

TOTAL                                            48,000.00                                            24,000.00                                            84,000.00                                                            144,000.00 

PRICE PER IMAGE DIAZO                                                  0.005                                                  0.009                                                  0.028                                                                 0.00633 

TOTAL IMAGES                                            2,400,000                                            2,400,000                                            2,400,000                                                              2,400,000 

TOTAL                                            12,000.00                                            21,600.00                                            67,200.00                                                              15,192.00 

TOTAL COST FOR FILMING BOUND BOOKS                                            60,000.00                                            45,600.00                                          163,200.00                                                            165,192.00 

TRANSPORTATION COST PER MILE                                                       -                                                      0.65                                                    0.75                                                                         - 

NUMBER OF MILES PER TRIP  N/C                                                  60.00                                                  70.00  N/C 

TOTAL NUMBER OF TRIPS                                                  10.00                                                  10.00                                                  10.00                                                                    10.00 

TOTAL COST FOR TRANSPORT                                                       -                                                   390.00                                                 525.00                                                                         - 

GRAND TOTAL WITH TRANSPORT                                          60,000.00                                        145,590.00                                        163,725.00                                                          165,192.00 

NON-BOUND DOCUMENTS

DOC PREP

PRICE PER PAGE                                                  0.010                                                  0.071                                                  0.010                                                                    0.020 

TOTAL PAGES                                               200,000                                               200,000                                               200,000                                                                 200,000 

TOTAL COST                                              2,000.00                                            14,200.00                                              2,000.00                                                                4,000.00 

PRICE PER IMAGE SILVER HALIDE                                                  0.029                                                  0.011                                                  0.035                                                                    0.094 

TOTAL IMAGES                                               200,000                                               200,000                                               200,000                                                                 200,000 

TOTAL                                              5,800.00                                              2,200.00                                              7,000.00                                                              18,800.00 

PRICE PER IMAGE DIAZO                                                 0.0027                                                 0.0050                                                 0.0013                                                                   0.0040 

TOTAL IMAGES                                               400,000                                               400,000                                               400,000                                                                 400,000 

TOTAL                                              1,080.00                                              2,000.00                                                 520.00                                                                1,600.00 

TRANSPORTATION COST PER MILE  N/C                                                    0.65                                                    0.75  N/C 

NUMBER OF MILES PER TRIP                                                       -                                                    60.00                                                  70.00                                                                         - 

TOTAL NUMBER OF TRIPS                                                  10.00                                                  10.00                                                  10.00                                                                    10.00 

COST FOR TRANSPORT                                                 390.00                                                 525.00 

GRAND TOTAL WITH TRANSPORT                                            8,880.00                                          18,790.00                                          10,045.00                                                            24,400.00 

OVERSIZED DOCS BLACK AND WHITE

DOC PREP

PRICE PER PAGE                                                  0.005                                                  0.198                                                  0.100                                                                    0.025 

TOTAL PAGES                                                 75,000                                                 75,000                                                 75,000                                                                   75,000 

TOTAL COST                                                 375.00                                            14,850.00                                              7,500.00                                                                1,875.00 

PRICE PER IMAGE SILVER HALIDE                                                  0.245                                                  0.037                                                  0.400                                                                    0.950 

TOTAL IMAGES                                              75,000.0                                            75,000.00                                            75,000.00                                                                75,000.0 

CK09MERCER2009-29 MICROFILMING FOR RECORDS MANAGEMENT FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR WITH OPTION TO EXTEND ONE YEAR 
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NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 4

CONTRACT PERIOD ONE YEAR WITH OPTION TO EXTEND 
ONE YEAR BASED UPON INDEX RATE; SUBCONTRACTORS 
NOT PERMISSIVE

NAME OF BIDDER
ALTERNATIVE MICROGRAPHICS, 

INC.
FW DUTTON, INC. T/A PMI 

TECHNOLOGIES
LARGEDOC SOLUTIONS ACES IMAGING SYSTEMS

CK09MERCER2009-29 MICROFILMING FOR RECORDS MANAGEMENT FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR WITH OPTION TO EXTEND ONE YEAR 
October 27, 2009

BID RESULTS

TOTAL                                            18,375.00                                              2,775.00                                            30,000.00                                                              71,250.00 

PRICE PER IMAGE DIAZO                                                  0.010                                                  0.016                                                  0.028                                                                    0.040 

TOTAL IMAGES                                               150,000                                               150,000                                               150,000                                                                 150,000 

TOTAL                                              1,500.00                                              2,400.00                                              4,200.00                                                                6,000.00 

TRANSPORTATION COST PER MILE                                                       -                                                      0.65                                                    0.75                                                                         - 

NUMBER OF MILES PER TRIP                                                       -                                                    60.00                                                  70.00                                                                         - 

TOTAL NUMBER OF TRIPS                                                  10.00                                                  10.00                                                  10.00                                                                    10.00 

COST FOR TRANSPORT                                                 390.00                                                 525.00 

GRAND TOTAL WITH TRANSPORT                                          20,250.00                                          20,415.00                                          42,225.00                                                            79,125.00 

OVERSIZED DOCS COLOR FILM  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

DOC PREP

PRICE PER PAGE

TOTAL PAGES

TOTAL COST

PRICE PER IMAGE 35mm MASTERS

TOTAL IMAGES

TOTAL

PRICE PER IMAGE 35mm USER ACCESS

TOTAL IMAGES

TOTAL

TRANSPORTATION COST PER MILE

NUMBER OF MILES PER TRIP

TOTAL NUMBER OF TRIPS

GRAND TOTAL WITH TRANSPORT

EXCEPTIONS NO BID - COLOR MICROFILM NO BID - COLOR MICROFILM NO BID - COLOR MICROFILM MATH ERROR PAGE 48; NO BID COLOR

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO



NO. OF RESPONDENTS 4

INSTALL ENERGY STAR RATED SYSTEMS

NAME OF BIDDER ARTHUR'S HEATING AND A/C
BINSKY & SNYDER SERVICES 

LLC
LEBRON MECHANICAL LLC RMK MECHANICAL

ADDRESS 6 TYSON DRIVE 281 CENTENNIAL AVE. 178 BUTTONWOOD DRIVE 52 LILLIAN AVENUE 

CITY, STATE, ZIP EWING, NJ PISCATAWAY, NJ 08854 MORRISVILLE, PA 08628 TRENTON, NJ 08610

CONTACT JESSIS ARTHUR MICHAEL R. RAPP MELVIN LEBRON RYAN M. KISIEL

TELEPHONE 771 1235 732-369-0100 609-672-2107 609 510 4341

FAX 771 8556 732-369-0200 609 994 3663

E-MAIL
ARTHUR'SHEATING@VERIZON.

ORG 
MRAPP@BINSKY.COM LEBRONHVAC@AOL.COM RMKHVAC@AOL.COM

BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE INCLUDED INCLUDED OK INCLUDED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE REQUIRED 12904 EXPIRES 2013 42492 EXPIRES 9/15/15 REQUIRED

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE SIGNED, SOLE PROP SIGNED, LLC WITH OWNERS SIGNED, LLC WITH OWNER
SIGNED, LLC WITH 

OWNER

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE INCLUDED AND OK NEED NEED REQUIRED

PW CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 666609 EXPIRES 10/06/10 604297 EXPIRES 4/10/10 665905 EXPIRES 8/27/10 673316 EXPIRES 9/20/10

HOME IMPROVEMENT CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION 13VH02388500 EXPIRES 12/31/09 13VH02806600 EXPIRES 12/31/09
13VH03532800 EXPIRES 

12/31/09
13VH01850300 EXPIRES 

12/31/09

COMPLY WITH EMERGENCY SCHEDULE YES YES YES YES

HVAC REPAIRS LABOR RATE PER HOUR                                                 85.00                                                 88.00                                            100.00                                     115.00 

PROPOSED MARK-UP RATE 10% 10% 10% 10%

EXCEPTIONS NO NO NO NONE

FATAL FLAWS NO NO NO NO

BID RESULTS
AB2009-45 REPAIR AND INSTALLATION OF RESIDENTIAL HEATING SYSTEMS AND HOT WATER TAKS FOR ONE YEAR PERIOD

October 27, 2009
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NO. OF RESPONDENTS 2

 

NAME OF BIDDER MHN SERVICES
JANUS ASSOC., INC.DBA BUSINESS 

HEALTH SERVICES

ADDRESS 2370 KERNER BLVD. 711 WEST 40TH STREET

CITY, STATE, ZIP SAN RAFAEL, CA 94901 BALTIMORE, MD 21211

CONTACT DIANA FAVAZZA DAWN MOTOVIDLAK

TELEPHONE 917 228 2339 800 765 3277

FAX 866 444 8289 410 889 7397

E-MAIL DIANA.M.FAVAZZA@MHN.COM DMOTOVIDLAK2BHSONLINE.COM

EXTEND PRICING TO COOP NOT ADDRESSED NOT ADDRESSED
RERERENCES ER TO CHECK

BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE NOT INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE REQUIRED REQUIRED

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE
DOES NOT REFERNCE NAMES OF 

SHAREHOLDERS - TO LEGAL
SIGNED WITH SH'S REFERENCED

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE 

COST PER SESSION (HISTORY 200)                                                                           2.01                                                          70.00 

BASED UPON 200
BASED PROPOSAL ON 2K EMPLOYEES 2.01 

PER EMPLOYEE PER MONTH
                                                            200 

TOTAL YEAR ONE                                                                  48,240.00                                                   14,000.00

TOTAL YEAR TWO                                                                  48,240.00                                                   14,000.00

TOTAL YEAR THREE                                                                  48,240.00                                                   14,000.00

ADMIN SERVICES ANNUALLY                                                   26,560.00

                                                  40,560.00

EXCEPTIONS TAKEN SECTION - FORMS NONE REFERENCED

FATAL FLAW
NO BRC - SH DISCLOSURE DOES NOT 

REFERENCE SHAREHOLDERS
NO BRC

RFP RESULTS
CC2009-05 EMPLOYEE ASSISTANCE PROGRAM

OCTOBER 28, 2009

mailto:DIANA.M.FAVAZZA@MHN.COM�


NO. OF RESPONDENTS 6

 

NAME OF BIDDER ROORK'S FARM SUPPLY, INC. HARTER EQUIPMENT INC.
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR 

SALES
WILFRED MACDONALD, INC.

CAMMPS HARDWARE & LAWN 
PRODUCTS, INC.

ADDRESS 163 ROUTE 77 615 STATE ROUTE 33 35 ROUTE 70 WEST 19 CENTRAL BLVD. 2168 ROUTE 206 

CITY, STATE, ZIP ELMER, NJ 08318 MILLSTONE TWP., NJ 08535 MARLTON, NJ 08053 S. HACKENSACK, NJ 07606 BELLE MEAD

CONTACT DANIEL T. ROORK SEAN SHEEHAN HAROLD WRIGHT, JR. CHRIS HUNT PETER KITCHIN

TELEPHONE 856 358 3100 732 446 7600 856 983 0111 888 831 0891 908 281 7575

FAX 856 358 3740 732 446 9255 856 988 6290 201 931 1730 908 281 6403

E-MAIL DAVE@ROORKS.COM SALES@HARTERINC.COM
HAROLD@CHERRYVALLEYTRACTOR.C

OM
CH@WILMAC.BIZ PETE.CAMMPS@COMCAST.NET

EXTEND PRICING TO COOP NO YES - UNTIL 12/31/09 ONLY YES YES YES

BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE OK OK OK OK OK

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE 34322 EXPIRES 2010 6914 EXPIRES 3/15/13 5598 EXPIRES 10/15/12 10203 EXPIRES 3/15/13

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE
SIGNED WITH SH'S 

REFERENCED
SIGNED WITH SH'S 

REFERENCED
SIGNED WITH SH'S 

REFERENCED
SIGNED WITH SH'S 

REFERENCED
SIGNED WITH SH'S 

REFERENCED

INSURANCE CERTIFICATE NEED IF LOW BIDDER NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED INCLUDED NEED IF AWARDED

2009 OR NEWER DEERE HPX UTILITY VEHICLE                                         12,495.00                                         10,575.00 NO BID NO BID                                        10,297.00 

BIDDING RTV900W KUBOTA RTV500W KUBOTA

2009 OR NEWER DEERE 997 ZERO TURN RADIUS 
MOWER

                                        12,995.00                                         12,540.00                                         11,886.29                                       13,288.00                                       12,824.00

BIDDING ZD331P-60 KUBOTA ZD331-60 KUBOTA ZD331P-60 KUBOTA ZD331P-60 KUBOTA BRAND

EXCEPTIONS
BIDDING KUBOTA - REFER TO 

PAGE 5 THROUGH 11
BIDDING KUBOTA - REFER TO 

PAGE 5 THROUGH 11
REFER TO SPECIFICATION 

SHEET - KUBOTA

BIDDING KUBOTA - REFER TO 
SPECIFICATION SHEET FROM 

KUBOTA
NO EXCEPTIONS

FATAL FLAW NO NO NO NO NO 

NAME OF BIDDER TRIUS, INC.

ADDRESS 5049 INDUSTRIAL ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP FARMINDALE, NJ 07727

CONTACT DOROTHY J. THEILEN

TELEPHONE 732-751-9611

FAX 732-751-9619

NO BID

BID RESULTS
CK09MERCER2009-32 JOHN DEERE OR EQUIVALENT 997 MOWER AND UTILITY VEHICLE FOR THE PARK COMMISSION

October 27, 2009
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