BID RESULTS

AB2009-21 REPLACEMENT DOORS AT MARINA

June 23, 2009

NO. OF RESPONDENTS

4

NAME OF BIDDER

LOUIS A. JAMMER CO., INC. DBA JAMMER DOORS

SMITTY'S DOOR SERVICE INC.

FREEHOLD CONTRACTORS LLC

JAMES DOORCHECK INC.

ADDRESS

2850 BRUNSWICK PIKE

170 OAK GROVE ROAD

92 WEST MAIN STREET SUITE 202

9027 TORRESDALE AVENUE

CITY, STATE, ZIP

LAWRENCEVILLE, NJ 08648

PITTSTOWN, NJ 08867

FREEHOLD, NJ 07728

PHILADELPHIA, PA 19136

CONTACT LOUIS A JAMMER GWEN SMITH JOSEPH BOSCO RAYMOND BATTAGLIA
TELEPHONE 609 883 0900 908 284 0506 732 618 0221 215 624 2500
FAX 609 883 0641 908 284 9558 732761 2444 215 624 2600

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL

JAMMERDOORS@MSN.COM

TIM@SMITTYSDOORS.COM

JIBOSCO13@AOL.COM

RAYBATTAGLIA@JAMESDOORCHECK.COM

INSURANCE NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED
REQUIRES AA201 FROM AWARDED CONTRACTOR X X X X
EXHIBIT B X X X X
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE X X X X
NON-COLLUSION X X X X
EQUIPMENT CERT X X X X
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION X X X X

PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION

606158 EXPIRES 03/06/10

616407 EXPIRES 6/26/10

665978 EXPIRES 8/28/09

604870 EXPIRES 3/11/10

RESPONSIBLE CONTRACTOR POLICY

SIGNED

SIGNED

SIGNED

SIGNED

99-1

SIGNED

SIGNED

SIGNED

SIGNED

LOCKSMTHING LICENSE

DID NOT INCLUDE

341L.X00000600 EXPIRES 1/31/11

DID NOT INCLUDE

34LX00002300 EXPIRES 1/31/11

SIGNED PROPOSAL oK oK oK oK

FRONT ENTRACE AND REAR DECK ENTRACE (2)

DOUNBLE ENTRY DOORS 9,650.00 10,950.04 9,000.0 9,800.0
KITCHEN ENTRANCE (1) SINGLE ENTRY DOOR 2,850.00 3,500.00 4,000.0 2,900.0
HALLWAY AND BALLROOM ENTRANCE (2) DOUBLE

ENTRY DOORS 5,500.00 6,200.00 7,875.0 4,800.0
TOTAL 18,000.04 20,650.00 20,875.0( 17,500.0
EXCEPTIONS NONE YES - PAGE 58 NONE

FATAL FLAW DOES NOT HAVE LOCKSMITH LICENSE NO DID NOT INCLUDE LOCKSMITH LICENSE NO
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mailto:RAYBATTAGLIA@JAMESDOORCHECK.COM�

CKO9MERCER2009-14 ROAD MATERIALS FOR COUNTY AND COOP

COOP BID FOR ROAD MATERIALS

June 23, 2009
NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS 3
REQUIRES PERFORMANCE BOND FROM AWARDED
CONTRACTOR(S) + M.P. TO ADD .75 PER MILE OVER ROUTE
SELECTED FROM POINT OF DELIVERY TO LOCATION OF INTENDED
USE; LOW BID IS EXTENDED TO COOP MEMBERS; TRAP ROCK AND
ARAWAK WILL NOT EXTEND
NAME OF BIDDER TRAP ROCK INDUSTRIES, INC. AMERICAN ASPHALT COMPANY INC. ARAWAK PAVING COMPANY, INC.
ADDRESS PO BOX 419 116 MAIN STREET 7503 WEYMOUTH ROAD
CITY, STATE, ZIP KINGSTON, NJ 08528 WEST COLLINGSWOOD, NJ 08059 HAMMONTON, NJ 08037
CONTACT GEORGE M. CONWAY JR. ROBERT BROWN, PRESIDENT JOHN M. BARRETT
WEBSITE OR E-MAIL BOBBRC ANASPHALTCOMPANY.COM oL.com
TELEPHONE 609-252-8927 856-456-2899 609-561-4100
FAX 609-497-0135 856-456-6749 609-567-4750
0,
BID GUARANTEE HARTFORD FIRE INSURANCE COMPANY 10% INTERNATIONAL FIDELIT;O:(NSURANCE €O. 10% NTE SAFECO INSURANCE COMPANY 10% NTE $20M
CONSENT OF SURETY LESLIE J. PASQUINI AIF WITH POA GREGORY J. RISNYCHOK AIF WITH POA DIANE M. DIMARTINO AIF WITH POA
MUST PROVIDE PERFORMANCE, LABOR AND
MATERIAL PAYMENT BOND
INSURANCE NEED WITH MC AS ADDITIONAL INSURED NEED WITH MC AS ADDITIONAL INSURED
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE #81 EXPIRES 4/15/11 #1697 EXPIRES 12/15/12
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE X X X
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION 2008 2009 X 2009 X 2008 2009 X
DESCRIPTION TONS UNIT
BIT MIX 1-4 32,500 MAY BE SUBS WITH I-5 22,500 51.25 54.00 1,215,000.00 41.90 942,750.00 43.50 54.00 1,215,000.00
BIT MIX I-5 22,500 51.25 54.00 SAME AS 1-4 42.90 965,250.00 44.50 55.00 1,237,500.00
STABILIZED BASE 1-2 5,000 49.25 52.00 260,000.00 39.50 197,500.00 40.00 49.00 245,000.00
PERMANENT ASPHALT REPAIR 100| NO BID| NO BID 119.00 11,900.00 NO BID
COARSE AGGREGATE #8 300 16.00 16.50 4,950.00 20.00| 6,000.00 NO BID
COARSE AGGREGATE #57 300 11.00 11.50 3,450.00 19.00) 5,700.00 NO BID
COARSE AGGREGATE 1 1/2 " 500 9.50 9.50 4,750.00 19.00) 9,500.00 NO BID
SCREENINGS 200 10.50| 11.00 2,200.00 19.00) 3,800.00 NO BID
SMALL CORE STONE 200 13.00 13.50 2,700.00 - NO BID
DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE 400 8.00 8.00 3,200.00 18.00) 7,200.00 -
TOTAL BASED UPON HIGHER OF 14 OR 15 1,496,250.00 1,206,850.00 1,482,500.00
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NAME OF BIDDER

TRAP ROCK INDUSTRIES, INC.

AMERICAN ASPHALT COMPANY INC.

ARAWAK PAVING COMPANY, INC.

ADDRESS

PO BOX 419

116 MAIN STREET

7503 WEYMOUTH ROAD

CITY, STATE, ZIP

KINGSTON, NJ 08528

WEST COLLINGSWOOD, NJ 08059

HAMMONTON, NJ 08037

HAMILTON TOWNSHIP

BIT MIX I-5 1,000 42.90 42,900.00
STABILIZED BASE 1-2 2,000 39.50 79,000.00
PERMANENT ASPHALT REPAIR 100 119.00 11,900.00
COARSE AGGREGATE #8 50 20.00: 1,000.00
COARSE AGGREGATE #57 50 19.00; 950.00
COARSE AGGREGATE 1 1/2 " 50 19.00; 950.00
SCREENINGS 50 19.00; 950.00
SMALL CORE STONE 50 NO BID

DENSE GRADED AGGREGATE BASE COURSE 100 18.00: 1,800.00
TOTAL HAMILTON TOWNSHIP 139,450.00
PRINCETON BOROUGH

BIT MIX 1-4 500 41.90 20,950.00
BIT MIX I-5 100 42.90 4,290.00
PERMANENT ASPHALT REPAIR 500 119.00 59,500.00
TOTAL PRINCETON BOROUGH 84,740.00
HOPEWELL TOWNSHIP

BIT MIX 1-4 2,000 41.90 83,800.00
BIT MIX I-5 1,000 42.90 42,900.00
STABILIZED BASE 1-2 2,000 39.50 79,000.00
COARSE AGGREGATE #57 100 19.00 1,900.00
COARSE AGGREGATE 1 1/2 " 50 19.00 950.00
SCREENINGS 100 19.00 1,900.00
TOTAL HOPEWELL TOWNSHIP 210,450.00

LAUREL AVENUE, KINGSTON; RT. 31
PENNINGTON; RT. 29 LAMBERTVILLE; MOORES

LOCATIONS STATION, RT. 29, TITUSVILLE; E. STATE STREET, 1701 RIVER ROAD, BURLINGTON, NJ 08016 14 STEEL ROAD NORTH, MORRISVILLE, PA
TRENTON; RTE. 130, FLORENCE; RTE. 206,
COLUMBUS
WILLING TO EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS NO YES NO

EXCEPTIONS

WILL NOT EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS

WILL NOT EXTEND TO COOP MEMBERS

FATAL FLAW

NO

NO

NO




PROVIDE CATALOGS TO MEDICAL, GC, HS NURSE, HEALTH OFFICER,

MEDICAL EXAMINER

NUMBER OF BIDDERS

6

NAME OF BIDDER

GERIMEDIX INC.

MCKESSON MEDICAL SURGICAL

ADDRESS

421 VAN BRUNT STREET

8121 TENTH AVENUE NORTH

CITY, STATE, ZIP

BROOKLYN, NY 11231

GOLDEN VALLEY, MN 55427

CONTACT JOEL MEZIE BILL BLANCHFILL

EMAIL JOZIEOO3@AOL.COM GOVERNMENT.SALES@MCKESSON.COM
TELEPHONE 1-800-289-4374 800-328-8111

FAX 718-643-9787 800-237-9766

INSURANCE NEED NEED

AFFIRMATIVE ACTION CERTIFICATE

32477 EXPIRES 6/15/16

4039 EXPIRES 6/15/10

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE X X
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION X X
EXTEND TO COOP YES YES

CATALOGS AND DISCOUNT

2009 GERIMEDIX 75% OFF

MCKESSON - NET PRICING; EXCLUDING DERMARITE AS
REFERENCED ON PRICING SCHEDULE

2009 ALIMED 5% OFF EXCLUDING TWO ALIMED ITEMS
THROUGH UNITED MEDICAL; NO FREIGHT FOR ORDERS
> $350.00 EXCLUDING OVERSIZED EQUIPMENT AND
TRUCK DELIVERIES

2009 SAMMONS PRESTON 5% OFF; EXCLUDING ITEMS
TO MCKESSON; NO FREIGHT FOR ORDERS > $150
EXCLUDING OVERSIZED EQUIPMENT AND TRUCK

DELIVERIES

EXCEPTIONS

DELIVERY AFTER 7 DAYS OF RECEIPT OF ORDER

DELIVERY FOB DESTINATION DOCK TO DOCK

FATAL FLAW

NO

NO
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BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2009-16 MEDICAL AND NON-PRESCRIPTION SUPPLIES

June 24, 2009

JML MEDICAL INC.

UNITED MEDICAL SUPPLIES, INC.

DERMARITE INDUSTRIES LLC

501 PROSPECT STREET, #98

25 CRAIG PLACE

3 EAST 26TH STREET

LAKEWOOD, NJ 08701

NORTH PLAINFIELD, NJ 07060

PATERSON, NJ 03514

KEVIN CARLIN

RAMAN ALAIGH

JOHN R. GWYNNE

ORDER@JMLMEDICAL.COM

RAYALAIGH@UNITEDMEDSUPPLIES.COM

JOHNGWYNNE@DERMARITE.COM

732 901 1600

800 UMS 0006

973 569 9000

732 901 1649

908 757 0079

973 569 9001

NEED NEED NEED
22401 EXPIRES 2/15/11 NEED 27810 EXPIRES 2014
X X X
X X X
YES YES YES

JML MEDICAL 5% DISCOUNT EXCLUDING DERMARITE

UNITED MEDICAL SUPPLIES CATALOG 18% OFF

DERMARITE MUNICIPAL PRICE SHEET 30% OFF
EXCLUDING ITEMS AWARDED TO MCKESSON

DELIVERY AFTER 7 DAYS OF RECEIPT OF ORDER

DELIVERY AFTER 7 DAYS OF RECEIPT OF ORDER

DELIVERY AFTER 1 DAY OF RECEIPT OF ORDER

NO

NO

NO
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NO BID:

DELCREST MEDICAL SUPPLIES LLC

BOUND TREE MEDICAL

2670 NOTTINGHAM WAY

PO BOX 8023

HAMILTON, NJ 08619

DUBLIN, OHIO 43016

DAVID GORDON

DAVE@DELCRESTMEDICAL.NET

609 586 1679

609 586 1758

NEED

7129 EXPIRES 3/15/13

X

X

YES

DELCREST PRICING 26% DISCOUNT

DELIVERY AFTER 1 DAY OF RECEIPT OF ORDER

NO
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BID RESULTS

CKO9MERCER2009-12 CARPET AND FLOORING INSTALLATION

June 25, 2009

NO. OF RESPONDENTS

4

NAME OF BIDDER

CONTRACT FLOORING SYSTEMS LLC

CARPET SHOWCASE

HOOD FLOORS INC.

COMMERCIAL INTERIORS DIRECT, INC.

ADDRESS

40 COLLEGE STREET

1488 RT. 22 EAST

61 YORK STREET

1 SOUTH CORPORATE DRIVE

CITY, STATE, ZIP

TRENTON, NJ 08611

BRIDGEWATER, NJ 08807

LAMBERTVILLE, NJ 08530

RIVERDALE, NJ 07457

CONTACT STEVE PARISH FRANK GOMES THOMAS J. HOOD STEVEN MULLER
TELEPHONE 609 393 0123 732 868 1300 609 397 2241 973 839 8394
FAX 609 393 0703 732 686 1221 609 397 2246 973 839 8376

WEBSITE OR E-MAIL

CONTFLRSYS@AOL.COM

FGOMES@CARPETSHOWCASE.COM

SALES@HOODFLOORS.COM

SALES@CIDINT.COM

INSURANCE NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED NEED IF AWARDED
REQUIRES EIC 43360 EXPIRES 5/15/16 19070 EXPIRES 5/15/16 18721 EXPIRES 3/15/16 16761 EXPIRES 6/15/15
EXHIBIT A INCLUDED INCLUDED INSERT EXHIBIT A INCLUDED
EXTEND TO COOP YES YES YES YES
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE X X X X

NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION X X X X

PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION

657224 EXPIRES 9/21/09

64740 EXPIRES 4/30/10

589242 EXPIRES 8/4/09

589927 EXPIRES 5/7/10

SIGNED PROPOSAL YES YES YES YES
ROPPE 4" X 1/8" COVE BASE INSTALLED 1.90 LINEAL FOOT
COST PER SQ. FT. SOLID VINYL TILE 7.40) 7.90) 9.79) 9.00
COST PER SQ. FT. VINYL COMPOSITION TILE 1.95 2.20) 1.50 4.52)
COST PER SQ. FT. RUBBER FLOOR TILE 8.80) 6.90) 11.49) 15.00
ALTERNATE: DISOSAL TO RECLAMATION FACILITY NO BID 5.84 8.00 7.50)
RECLAMATION FACILITY CARPET CYCLE REVOLUTION RECYCLING CARPET CYCLE
WARRANTY ONE YEAR ON ALL LABOR; 10 YEARS ON| 1| bRoVIDE 18 MONTH WARRANTY FOR LABOR
MATERIALS
VENDOR DID NOT PROVIDE HOURLY RATE FOR

EXCEPTIONS FURNITURE MOVING AS REQUIRD FOR LOW BID PAGE 50 (IF AWARDED, MUST BE INCLUDED)

DETERMINATION
FATAL FLAW NON-RESPONSIVE BIDDER PER LEGAL NO NO
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