[EXTERNAL] Re: AN-072 Supplement #1 - Active

Nick Smarrito <NSmarrito@active-env.com>
Thu 11/12/2020 11:55 AM

To: Alison Keating <Alison.Keating@law.njoag.gov>

Alison

Yes Active agrees to the terms ,thanks have a good day and be safe .

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 12, 2020, at 11:02 AM, Alison Keating <Alison.Keating@law.njoag.gov>
wrote:

Mr. Smarrito,

So the Division of Law can conclude our review of Supplement 1 to Waiver

AN-072, kindly confirm our understanding that the agreement previously

entered into between your company and the State will remain in effect

through the extension of the waiver, as follows:

The Agreement executed by Active on June 10, 2020, between
Active and the State of New Jersey, Department of the Treasury,
Division of Purchase and Property, on behalf of the State of New
Jersey, Department of Property Management and Construction (the
“Agreement”), and each of the documents referenced in paragraph 1
of the Agreement, are and shall be extended and shall continue in full
force and effect for the period of July 1, 2020 through June 30, 2021
in connection with Supplement 1 to Waiver AN-072 for cleaning and
disinfecting services for State of New Jersey buildings with instances
of COVID-19 positive or presumptive positive cases and any
subsequent supplements to Waiver AN-072, except to the extent
amended, supplemented or replaced by a written agreement of the
parties.

Please let me know by return email if you agree with the above.

Thank you.

Alison Keating

Deputy Attorney General

Office of the Attorney General

Division of Law, Treasury - Finance & Benefits
25 Market Street, P.O. Box 106

6 F1. West, Rm. 6-55
Trenton, NJ 08625-0106
Phone: (609) 376-2905
Fax: (609) 777-3515



E-Mail: Alison.Keating@law.njoag.gov

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE The information contained in this communication from
the Office of the New Jersey Attorney General is privileged and confidential and is
intended for the sole use of the persons or entities who are the addressees. If you
are not an intended recipient of this e-mail, the dissemination, distribution, copying
or use of the information it contains is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please immediately contact the Office of the Attorney
General at (609) 292-4925 to arrange for the return of this information.



Petroni, Maria

From: Weitz, Lisa

Sent: Friday, August 21, 2020 12:55 PM
To: Piwonski, Nadeen; Petroni, Maria
Ce: Bunch, Georgette

Subject: FW: waiver acceptance

Maria,

Please see the email below from Active Environmental.
Thank you!

Lisa Weitz

Department of the Treasury

Division of Property Management & Construction
Bureau of Special Services

phone (609)292-0232

From: Bunch, Georgette <Georgette.Bunch@treas.nj.gov>
Sent: Friday, August 21, 2020 12:53 PM

To: Weitz, Lisa <Lisa.Weitz@treas.nj.gov>

Subject: FW: waiver acceptance

From: Nick Smarrito [mailto:NSmarrito@active-env.com]
Sent: Friday, August 21, 2020 12:23 PM

To: Bunch, Georgette <Georgette.Bunch@treas.nj.gov>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] waiver acceptance

Georgette,
Please accept this email as Active Environmental Technologies acceptance of agreement to extend the waiver till
6/30/2021, if you need any further information please let me know, thanks be safe and have a good day.

Sincerely,

Nick Smarrito
Director of Disaster Divison

Active-/\\/-

Environmental Technologies, inc.

203 Pine Street | Mount Holly, NJ 08060
Office: 609.702.1500 Ext. 244

Cell: 856-298-2555

Fax: 609.702.0265



Email: nsmarrito@active-env.com

www.active-env.com

This e-mail, and any attachments, are intended only for use by the addressee(s) named herein and may contain legally privileged and/or

confidential information. It is the property of Active Environmental Technologies, Inc. If you are not the intended recipient of this email, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email, any attachments thereto, and any use of the information contained
is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify our office at (609) 702-1500 and permanently delete the original and

any copy thereof

b% Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.



